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Group No. 1: Pleated Throw-Away Air Filters New Mexico Air Filter Gorman Industries Tri-Dim Filter Richards Technologies Aire Filter Products NM Fastenal Company
Item No. Depth Width Height Quantity Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost Unit Price Total Cost
1         1 20 25 x 54           2.66 143.64           2.91         157.14           2.60                140.40            18.99       1,025.46           2.11               113.94                 2.26         122.04           
2         1 15 20 x 54 2.10         113.40           2.33         125.82           2.26                122.04            18.99       1,025.46           2.17               117.18                 1.96         105.84           
3         1 12 53 x 18 6.35         114.30           11.73       211.14           6.06                109.08            29.95       539.10              5.15               92.70                   8.93         160.74           
4         2 8 16 x 54 4.63         250.02           5.46         294.84           3.77                203.58            18.99       1,025.46           3.93               212.22                 3.61         194.94           
5         2 12 24 x 126 2.17         273.42           2.40         302.40           2.26                284.76            18.99       2,392.74           1.88               236.88                 1.75         220.50           
6         2 15 24 x 48 6.56         314.88           6.00         288.00           4.92                236.16            20.99       1,007.52           5.56               266.88                 4.90         235.20           
7         2 16 16 x 48 5.51         264.48           2.47         118.56           4.34                208.32            18.25       876.00              4.58               219.84                 3.68         176.64           
8         2 16 25 x 255 2.35         599.25           2.69         685.95           2.65                675.75            18.25       4,653.75           2.21               563.55                 1.93         492.15           
9         2 16 24 x 216 2.81         606.96           2.95         637.20           2.60                561.60            18.25       3,942.00           2.54               548.64                 2.55         550.80           
10      2 20 25 x 165 2.70         445.50           2.96         488.40           2.99                493.35            18.25       3,011.25           2.51               414.15                 2.23         367.95           
11      2 20 24 x 48 2.81         134.88           3.01         144.48           2.95                141.60            18.25       876.00              2.51               120.48                 2.64         126.72           
12      2 20 20 x 144 2.35         338.40           2.69         387.36           2.65                381.60            18.25       2,628.00           2.23               321.12                 1.95         280.80           
13      2 22 16 x 180 6.56         1,180.80        6.00         1,080.00        4.92                885.60            20.00       3,600.00           5.56               1,000.80              4.90         882.00           
14      2 24 24 x 5025 3.11         15,627.75      3.38         16,984.50      3.34                16,783.50       18.95       95,223.75         2.81               14,120.25            2.51         12,612.75      
15      2 25 18 x 405 2.81         1,138.05        2.96         1,198.80        2.84                1,150.20         18.95       7,674.75           2.86               1,158.30              2.94         1,190.70        
16      4 12 24 x 24 4.01         96.24             4.26         102.24           3.54                84.96              18.95       454.80              4.60               110.40                 3.31         79.44             
17      4 12 25 x 18 4.85         87.30             8.73         157.14           6.45                116.10            28.50       513.00              8.08               145.44                 5.50         99.00             
18      4 20 25 x 147 5.51         809.97           5.74         843.78           4.42                649.74            10.90       1,602.30           5.16               758.52                 4.78         702.66           
19      4 24 24 x 48 6.08         291.84           6.23         299.04           4.81                230.88            17.54       841.92              4.60               220.80                 4.33         207.84           
20      4 28 30 x 12 9.66         115.92           9.42         113.04           14.93              179.16            66.00       792.00              14.88             178.56                 17.11       205.32           

Group 1 Total: 22,947.00$                       24,619.83$                        23,638.38$                              133,705.26$                        20,920.65$                                  19,014.03$                        
Local Preference 21,799.65$                       127,020.00$                        19,874.62$                                  

Notes: Secondary Award Primary Award

Group No. 2: Carbonated Air Filters
Item No. Depth Width Height Quantity

21 2 16 24 x 96 17.99       1,727.04        9.48         910.08           22.30              2,140.80         88.00       8,448.00           18.28             1,754.88              27.26       2,616.96        
22 2 24 12 x 120 15.40       1,848.00        7.00         840.00           18.38              2,205.60         81.00       9,720.00           15.73             1,887.60              15.48       1,857.60        
23 2 24 24 x 2200 19.23       42,306.00      10.71       23,562.00      24.50              53,900.00       110.00     242,000.00       25.16             55,352.00            27.19       59,818.00      
24 2 25 25 x 32 25.65       820.80           13.18       421.76           58.30              1,865.60         125.00     4,000.00           32.62             1,043.84              30.96       990.72           

Group 2 Total: 46,701.84$                       25,733.84$                        60,112.00$                              264,168.00$                        60,038.32$                                  65,283.28$                        
Local Preference 44,366.75$                       250,959.60$                        57,036.40$                                  

Notes: Does not meet 3.3 Does not meet 3.2 Secondary Award Primary Award

Group No. 3: Metalbox Frame Header Air Filters
Item No. Depth Width Height Quantity

25 2 24 24 x 18 35.20       633.60           56.46       1,016.28        28.11              505.98            88.00       1,584.00           88.00            1,584.00             40.50       729.00           
26 12 12 24 x 24 21.88       525.12           45.07       1,081.68        110.00           2,640.00         110.00     2,640.00           32.00             768.00                 35.76       858.24           
27 12 24 12 x 80 21.88       1,750.40        45.07       3,605.60        30.69              2,455.20         110.00     8,800.00           32.00             2,560.00              42.80       3,424.00        
28 12 24 24 x 2100 35.20       73,920.00      56.46       118,566.00    38.62              81,102.00       112.00     235,200.00       42.48             89,208.00            52.62       110,502.00    

Group 3 Total: 76,829.12$                       124,269.56$                      86,703.18$                              248,224.00$                        94,120.00$                                  115,513.24$                      
Local Preference 72,987.66$                       235,812.80$                        89,414.00$                                  

Notes: Primary Award Secondary Award

Group No. 4: Metalbox Frame with Dual Header Air Filters
Item No. Depth Width Height Quantity

29 12 12 24 x 80 26.88       2,150.40        53.14       4,251.20        48.00              3,840.00         110.00     8,800.00           33.08             2,646.40              35.46       2,836.80        
30 12 24 24 x 100 40.20       4,020.00        72.93       7,293.00        68.00              6,800.00         120.00     12,000.00         43.85             4,385.00              48.64       4,864.00        

Group 4 Total: 6,170.40$                         11,544.20$                        10,640.00$                              20,800.00$                          7,031.40$                                    7,700.80$                          
Local Preference 5,861.88$                         19,760.00$                          6,679.83$                                    

Notes: Primary Award Secondary Award

Group No. 5: Panel Filters
Item No. Depth Width Height Quantity

31  3/4 6 3/4 26 x 12 2.67         32.04             1.64         19.68             3.02                36.24              18.25       219.00              12.12             145.44                 5.68         68.16             
32 1 6 3/4 21 x 72 2.51         180.72           1.56         112.32           3.02                217.44            18.25       1,314.00           12.12             872.64                 5.68         408.96           
33 1 10 20 x 12 3.17         38.04             0.85         10.20             3.02                36.24              15.95       191.40              2.27               27.24                   3.15         37.80             
34 1 10 24 x 48 3.17         152.16           0.91         43.68             3.02                144.96            15.95       765.60              12.12             581.76                 6.48         311.04           
35 1 10 28 x 12 3.44         41.28             2.38         28.56             3.07                36.84              15.95       191.40              12.12             145.44                 6.48         77.76             
36 1 10 32 x 148 3.68         544.64           2.54         375.92           3.12                461.76            15.25       2,257.00           12.12             1,793.76              8.24         1,219.52        
37 1 10 39 x 12 3.68         44.16             2.05         24.60             3.22                38.64              15.25       183.00              12.12             145.44                 8.24         98.88             
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38 1 10 45 x 24 3.82         91.68             2.70         64.80             3.51                84.24              15.25       366.00              18.20             436.80                 7.24         173.76           
39 1 11 3/4 31 1/2 x 147 3.68         540.96           2.54         373.38           3.22                473.34            15.25       2,241.75           12.12             1,781.64              8.24         1,211.28        
40 1 12 12 x 12 2.51         30.12             0.91         10.92             3.02                36.24              15.25       183.00              9.76               117.12                 5.68         68.16             
41 1 12 16 x 87 2.67         232.29           2.05         178.35           3.02                262.74            15.25       1,326.75           9.76               849.12                 5.68         494.16           
42 1 12 17 x 24 3.17         76.08             1.72         41.28             3.02                72.48              15.25       366.00              9.76               234.24                 6.48         155.52           
43 1 12 20 x 24 3.17         76.08             0.85         20.40             3.02                72.48              15.25       366.00              9.76               234.24                 6.48         155.52           
44 1 12 24 x 111 2.42         268.62           0.85         94.35             1.86                206.46            15.25       1,692.75           2.55               283.05                 2.95         327.45           
45 1 12 36 x 12 3.82         45.84             2.70         32.40             3.46                41.52              15.70       188.40              9.76               117.12                 7.24         86.88             
46 1 13 30 x 12 3.68         44.16             2.54         30.48             3.22                38.64              15.70       188.40              12.12             145.44                 8.24         98.88             
47 1 14 20 x 24 3.44         82.56             0.85         20.40             3.07                73.68              15.25       366.00              12.12             290.88                 6.48         155.52           
48 1 14 24 x 99 3.68         364.32           1.14         112.86           3.12                308.88            15.25       1,509.75           12.12             1,199.88              8.24         815.76           
49 1 14 25 x 87 3.68         320.16           0.85         73.95             3.12                271.44            15.75       1,370.25           12.12             1,054.44              8.24         716.88           
50 1 14 30 x 12 3.82         45.84             1.29         15.48             3.46                41.52              15.75       189.00              12.12             145.44                 7.24         86.88             
51 1 15 20 x 171 3.68         629.28           0.85         145.35           1.86                318.06            15.25       2,607.75           12.12             2,072.52              8.24         1,409.04        
52 1 16 16 x 99 3.44         340.56           0.91         90.09             3.07                303.93            15.25       1,509.75           12.12             1,199.88              6.48         641.52           
53 1 16 19 x 12 3.68         44.16             2.54         30.48             3.12                37.44              15.25       183.00              12.81             153.72                 8.24         98.88             
54 1 16 20 x 759 2.57         1,950.63        0.82         622.38           1.91                1,449.69         15.25       11,574.75         2.62               1,988.58              3.13         2,375.67        
55 1 16 20 x 204 2.57         524.28           0.82         167.28           1.91                389.64            15.25       3,111.00           2.62               534.48                 3.13         638.52           
56 1 16 24 x 12 2.98         35.76             1.14         13.68             2.48                29.76              15.25       183.00              12.81             153.72                 8.24         98.88             
57 1 16 25 x 327 2.75         899.25           0.82         268.14           2.21                722.67            17.70       5,787.90           3.02               987.54                 3.50         1,144.50        
58 1 16 5/8 24 x 232 3.82         886.24           2.70         626.40           3.46                802.72            15.50       3,596.00           12.53             2,906.96              7.24         1,679.68        
59 1 17 18 x 12 3.68         44.16             2.54         30.48             3.12                37.44              15.50       186.00              12.53             150.36                 8.24         98.88             
60 1 17 30 x 24 4.12         98.88             2.83         67.92             3.76                90.24              15.50       372.00              12.53             300.72                 9.06         217.44           
61 1 18 18 x 24 3.68         88.32             1.14         27.36             3.12                74.88              17.25       414.00              12.53             300.72                 8.24         197.76           
62 1 18 20 x 111 3.68         408.48           1.14         126.54           3.22                357.42            15.50       1,720.50           12.53             1,390.83              8.24         914.64           
63 1 18 24 x 24 2.87         68.88             1.14         27.36             2.63                63.12              17.25       414.00              12.53             300.72                 7.24         173.76           
64 1 18 25 x 87 3.82         332.34           1.14         99.18             3.51                305.37            17.25       1,500.75           12.53             1,090.11              7.24         629.88           
65 1 18 3/4 25 x 24 3.82         91.68             2.70         64.80             3.51                84.24              17.25       414.00              12.53             300.72                 7.24         173.76           
66 1 19 19 x 12 3.68         44.16             2.54         30.48             3.22                38.64              17.25       207.00              12.53             150.36                 8.24         98.88             
67 1 19 30 x 12 4.06         48.72             2.83         33.96             3.90                46.80              18.68       224.16              12.53             150.36                 9.06         108.72           
68 1 19 1/2 22 1/4 x 87 3.82         332.34           2.70         234.90           3.51                305.37            18.25       1,587.75           14.22             1,237.14              7.24         629.88           
69 1 20 20 x 303 2.75         833.25           0.82         248.46           2.21                669.63            15.25       4,620.75           3.02               915.06                 3.45         1,045.35        
70 1 20 24 x 87 2.87         249.69           1.20         104.40           2.63                228.81            18.25       1,587.75           3.28               285.36                 3.77         327.99           
71 1 20 25 x 447 2.93         1,309.71        0.92         411.24           2.70                1,206.90         12.50       5,587.50           3.36               1,501.92              3.89         1,738.83        
72 1 20 26 x 12 4.06         48.72             2.83         33.96             3.76                45.12              18.06       216.72              13.16             157.92                 9.06         108.72           
73 1 20 28 x 12 4.06         48.72             2.83         33.96             3.90                46.80              18.06       216.72              13.16             157.92                 9.06         108.72           
74 1 20 30 x 36 4.12         148.32           1.41         50.76             3.96                142.56            18.06       650.16              13.16             473.76                 9.29         334.44           
75 1 21 21 x 24 3.82         91.68             2.70         64.80             3.46                83.04              18.06       433.44              14.22             341.28                 7.24         173.76           
76 1 23 27 x 12 4.12         49.44             2.99         35.88             3.96                47.52              18.06       216.72              14.22             170.64                 9.29         111.48           
77 1 24 24 x 36 3.11         111.96           1.29         46.44             3.00                108.00            18.06       650.16              3.58               128.88                 3.77         135.72           
78 1 24 25 x 36 4.12         148.32           2.99         107.64           3.96                142.56            18.06       650.16              14.22             511.92                 9.29         334.44           
79 1 25 25 x 123 3.36         413.28           1.29         158.67           3.34                410.82            18.06       2,221.38           3.67               451.41                 9.29         1,142.67        
80 1 28 28 x 12 4.52         54.24             3.13         37.56             4.25                51.00              19.25       231.00              7.13               85.56                   10.88       130.56           
81 2 11 3/4 19 3/4 x 2 4.61         9.22               2.60         5.20               3.02                6.04                18.06       36.12                13.07             26.14                   6.48         12.96             
82 2 11 3/4 24 1/2 x 77 4.80         369.60           4.82         371.14           3.12                240.24            18.06       1,390.62           13.07             1,006.39              8.24         634.48           
83 2 12 24 x 36 2.78         100.08           1.21         43.56             1.86                66.96              14.25       513.00              2.73               98.28                   1.98         71.28             
84 2 14 25 x 24 4.80         115.20           1.21         29.04             2.35                56.40              15.25       366.00              13.07             313.68                 8.24         197.76           
85 2 15 20 x 12 2.88         34.56             1.21         14.52             1.86                22.32              15.25       183.00              13.07             156.84                 8.24         98.88             
86 2 16 16 x 159 4.61         732.99           1.21         192.39           3.07                488.13            15.25       2,424.75           13.72             2,181.48              6.48         1,030.32        
87 2 16 20 x 275 2.94         808.50           1.21         332.75           1.91                525.25            15.25       4,193.75           2.81               772.75                 2.11         580.25           
88 2 16 24 x 36 3.43         123.48           1.58         56.88             2.48                89.28              15.25       549.00              13.72             493.92                 8.24         296.64           
89 2 16 25 x 384 3.36         1,290.24        1.21         464.64           2.21                848.64            15.25       5,856.00           3.24               1,244.16              2.35         902.40           
90 2 20 20 x 783 3.10         2,427.30        1.21         947.43           2.21                1,730.43         15.25       11,940.75         3.24               2,536.92              3.45         2,701.35        
91 2 20 24 x 24 3.36         80.64             1.32         31.68             2.63                63.12              18.85       452.40              3.86               92.64                   3.77         90.48             
92 2 20 25 x 519 3.75         1,946.25        1.32         685.08           2.70                1,401.30         18.85       9,783.15           2.93               1,520.67              3.89         2,018.91        
93 2 24 24 x 120 3.66         439.20           1.58         189.60           3.00                360.00            18.85       2,262.00           3.34               400.80                 3.77         452.40           
94 2 25 25 x 24 4.13         99.12             1.58         37.92             3.34                80.16              18.80       451.20              4.89               117.36                 9.29         222.96           
95 4 16 25 x 24 4.13         99.12             5.06         121.44           15.25             366.00            15.25       366.00              3.44               82.56                   2.35         56.40             
96 4 20 25 x 96 4.69         450.24           5.74         551.04           15.25             1,464.00         15.25       1,464.00           4.19               402.24                 3.89         373.44           

Group 5 Total 22,752.94$                       9,798.87$                          19,404.24$     110,582.96$                        42,599.03$                                  33,532.65$                        
Local Preference 21,615.29$                       105,053.81$                        40,469.08$                                  

Notes: Secondary Award Does not meet 5.3 Primary Award

** Amounts listed in Red represent where the bidder did not submit a price.  In these instances the highest price submited by all bidders was applied.



   AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II 
 ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT 

 Response Vendor  Preference 
 Number Name Type Delivery Notes 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 1 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER LOCAL BUSI 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 2 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 3 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 4 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES LOCAL BUSI 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 5 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM LOCAL BUSI 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 6 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 __________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-020-SB 
 BID TITLE: AIR FILTERS 
 BID OPENING DATE: 8/30/2006 
 SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320 
 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 1 1 1 
 GROUP NO. 1 PLEATED THROW- 
 RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA EA EA EA EA 
 UNIT PRICE $22,947.0000 $24,619.8300 $23,638.3800 $133,705.2600 $20,920.6500 
 EXT. PRICE $22,947.00 $24,619.83 $23,638.38 $133,705.26 $20,920.65 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 1 1 1 
 GROUP NO. 1 PLEATED THROW- 
 RESPONSE 6 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA 
 UNIT PRICE $19,014.0300 
 EXT. PRICE $19,014.03 
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 REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-020-SB 
 BID TITLE: AIR FILTERS 
 BID OPENING DATE: 8/30/2006 
 SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320 
 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 2 2 1 
 GROUP NO. 2 CARBONATED AIR  
 RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA EA EA EA EA 
 UNIT PRICE $46,701.8400 $25,733.8400 $60,112.0000 $264,168.0000 $60,038.3200 
 EXT. PRICE $46,701.84 $25,733.84 $60,112.00 $264,168.00 $60,038.32 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 2 2 1 
 GROUP NO. 2 CARBONATED AIR  
 RESPONSE 6 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA 
 UNIT PRICE $65,283.2800 
 EXT. PRICE $65,283.28 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 3 3 1 
 GROUP NO. 3 METALBOX FRAME  
 RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA EA EA EA EA 
 UNIT PRICE $76,829.1200 $124,269.5600 $86,703.1800 $248,224.0000 $94,120.0000 
 EXT. PRICE $76,829.12 $124,269.56 $86,703.18 $248,224.00 $94,120.00 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 3 3 1 
 GROUP NO. 3 METALBOX FRAME  
 RESPONSE 6 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA 
 UNIT PRICE $115,513.2400 
 EXT. PRICE $115,513.24 
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 REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-020-SB 
 BID TITLE: AIR FILTERS 
 BID OPENING DATE: 8/30/2006 
 SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320 
 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 4 4 1 
 GROUP NO. 4 METALBOX FRAME  
 RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA EA EA EA EA 
 UNIT PRICE $6,170.4000 $11,544.2000 $10,640.0000 $20,800.0000 $7,031.4000 
 EXT. PRICE $6,170.40 $11,544.20 $10,640.00 $20,800.00 $7,031.40 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 4 4 1 
 GROUP NO. 4 METALBOX FRAME  
 RESPONSE 6 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA 
 UNIT PRICE $7,700.8000 
 EXT. PRICE $7,700.80 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 5 5 1 
 GROUP NO. 5 PANEL FILTERS 
 RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA EA EA EA EA 
 UNIT PRICE $22,752.9400 $9,798.8700 $19,404.2400 $110,582.9600 $42,599.0300 
 EXT. PRICE $22,752.94 $9,798.87 $19,404.24 $110,582.96 $42,599.03 

 GROUP ITEM QTY 
 5 5 1 
 GROUP NO. 5 PANEL FILTERS 
 RESPONSE 6 
 NO BID? 
 SKU EA 
 UNIT PRICE $33,532.6500 
 EXT. PRICE $33,532.65 
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   AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II 
 OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT 

 REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-020-SB 
 BID TITLE: AIR FILTERS 
 SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320 

 Item  Bid Amount Discounted  Vendor  
======================================================================================================================================================== 
 From Item No.: 1 To Item No.: 1 
 $19,014.03 $19,014.03 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 $20,920.65 $19,874.62 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM 
 $22,947.00 $21,799.65 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER 
 $23,638.38 $23,638.38 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 $24,619.83 $24,619.83 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 $133,705.26 $127,020.00 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES 
 ======================================================================================================================================================== 
 From Item No.: 2 To Item No.: 2 
 $25,733.84 $25,733.84 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 DOES NOT MEET 3.2. 
 $46,701.84 $44,366.75 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER 
 DOES NOT MEET 3.3. 
 $60,038.32 $57,036.40 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM 
 $60,112.00 $60,112.00 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 $65,283.28 $65,283.28 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 $264,168.00 $250,959.60 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES 
 ======================================================================================================================================================== 
 From Item No.: 3 To Item No.: 3 
 $76,829.12 $72,987.66 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER 
 $86,703.18 $86,703.18 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 $94,120.00 $89,414.00 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM 
 $115,513.24 $115,513.24 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 $124,269.56 $124,269.56 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 $248,224.00 $235,812.80 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES 
 ======================================================================================================================================================== 
 * Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid' 
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 REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-020-SB 
 BID TITLE: AIR FILTERS 
 SUZANNE BOEHLAND, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320 

 Item  Bid Amount Discounted  Vendor  
======================================================================================================================================================== 
 From Item No.: 4 To Item No.: 4 
 $6,170.40 $5,861.88 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER 
 $7,031.40 $6,679.83 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM 
 $7,700.80 $7,700.80 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 $10,640.00 $10,640.00 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 $11,544.20 $11,544.20 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 $20,800.00 $19,760.00 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES 
 ======================================================================================================================================================== 
 From Item No.: 5 To Item No.: 5 
 $9,798.87 $9,798.87 GORMAN INDUSTRIES 
 DOES NOT MEET 5.3 
 $19,404.24 $19,404.24 TRI-DIM FILTERS 
 $22,752.94 $21,615.29 NEW MEXICO AIR FILTER 
 $33,532.65 $33,532.65 FASTENAL COMPANY 
 $42,599.03 $40,469.08 AIRE FILTERS PRODUCTS NM 
 $110,582.96 $105,053.81 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES 
 ======================================================================================================================================================== 
 Total Offers = 30 

 * Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid' 
 October 23, 2006 Page 2 of 2 
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