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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008-

051-DG

NOVEMBER 13, 2007

BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007

TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS,

COMMERCIAL GRADE

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1-37 various VARIOUS PAINT ITEMS  SHERWIN-WILLIAMS CO SEE BID $444,245.00 NET
40 - 41 816 15T STREET NW
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87102
38-39  VARIOUS CERYLIUM ACRYILIC DUNN-EDWARDS $39.60/$41.80  $40,720.90 NET

215 ROSSMOOR RD Sw
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87105

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_J/ /.’21/47
T

APPROVED:

/Q%

JOHN J. V
PURC

/" ‘//Zw}

(DATE)

. DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:

tidife
{1414,



Item

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG

BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From item No.: 1

To ltem 41
$0.00

$343,025.00

$459,335.00

$517,665.00

$527,325.00

$687,175.00

$0.00

$325,873.75

$459,335.00

$491,781.75

$527,325.00

$652,816.25

D & B AUTO COLORLLC
DID NOT QUOTE ITEMS. WAS OFFERING AUTO PAINT.

* CLEMMENS ACE HARDWARE
ONLY OFFERED SOME ITEMS. PRICE FOR ITEMS OFFERED WAS STILL HIGHER THAN
LOW BIDDER'S PRICE FOR THE SAME LIST OF ITEMS. NOT LOW BIDDER.

SHERWIN WILLIAMS CO

DID NOT OFFER REQUESTED ITEM OR ACCEPTABLE SUBSTITUE FOR ITEMS 38 & 39.
THOSE 2 ITEMS DISQUALIFIED. ALL OTHER ITEMS WERE ACCEPTABLE. OVERALL LOW
BIDDER.

CUSTOM PAINT COLOR
NOT LOW BID. DID OFFER CORRECT PRODUCT FOR ITEMS 38 & 39 BUT WAS NOT THE
LOWEST PRICE.

* DIAMOND VOGEL PAINT
DID NOT OFFER ITEMS #38 AND #39.

DUNN - EDWARDS
OFFERED CORRECT PRODUCT FOR ITEMS #38 AND # 39. OFFERED LOWEST PRICE FOR
THESE ITEMS.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No

November 13, 2007

Total Offers 6
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GROUP {TEM QTY

1 2 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR LATEX,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 2 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR LATEX,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 3 2000
EXTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL.,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $16.5200
EXT. PRICE $33,040.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 3 2000
EXTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL.,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$11.5200 $11.0000 $7.0700
$11,520.00 $11,000.00 $7,070.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$13.4400 $12.5000 $11.1100
$26,880.00 $25,000.00 $22,220.00

5
GL

$8.7100
$8,710.00

5
GL

$13.2100
$26,420.00
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes

1 CLEMMENS ACE HARDWARE LOCAL BUSI 7 DAYS

2 DUNN - EDWARDS STATE BUSI

3 DIAMOND VOGEL PAINT 8 HRS ARO

4 SHERWIN WILLIAMS CO AS NEEDED

5 CUSTOM PAINT COLOR LOCAL BUSI 2 DAYS ARO

6 D & B AUTO COLOR LLC LOCAL BUSI

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 1 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y
SKU GL GL GL GL
UNIT $0.0000 $12.0100 $6.1000 $8.6500
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $12,010.00 $6,100.00 $8,650.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 1 1000

INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

5
GL

$8.7100
$8,710.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2000
INTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $15.5800
EXT. PRICE $31,160.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 4 2000
INTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 2000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $16.5200
EXT. PRICE $33,040.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 2000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$13.3100 $11.0000 $10.0900
$26,620.00 $22,000.00 $20,180.00

2 3 4

EA EA EA
$15.8900 $20.0000 $10.3800
$31,780.00 $40,000.00 $20,760.00

5
GL

$10.1000
$20,200.00

5
EA

$9.7100
$19,420.00

Page 3 of 21



GROUP ITEM QTY

1 6 2000
INTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $16.5200
EXT. PRICE $33,040.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 2000
INTERIOR LATEX ENAMEL,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 7 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 7 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$13.7000 $13.0000 $10.9300
$27,400.00 $26,000.00 $21,860.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$15.8900 $15.5000 $10.3800
$15,890.00 $15,500.00 $10,380.00

5
GL

$9.7100
$19,420.00

5
GL

$10.1000
$10,100.00

Page 4 of 21



GROUP ITEM QTy

1 8 3000
INTERIOR ACRYLIC, SEMI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 8 3000
INTERIOR ACRYLIC, SEMI
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 2000
INTERIOR LATEX, FLAT, LOW
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 2000
INTERIOR LATEX, FLAT, LOW
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BiID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$22.8100 $19.0000 $15.4100
$68,430.00 $57,000.00 $46,230.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$16.1900 $14.5900 $12.7700
$32,380.00 $29,180.00 $25,540.00

5
GL

$15.8100
$47,430.00

5
GL

$12.8200
$25,640.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy

1 10 500
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 10 500
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 11 500
EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $18.9600
EXT. PRICE $9,480.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 11 500
EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$23.5400 $19.4000 $10.4700
$11,770.00 $9,700.00 $5,235.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$21.0800 $16.5000 $7.4300
$10,540.00 $8,250.00 $3,715.00

5
GL

$11.3200
$5,660.00

5
GL

$12.8800
$6,440.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 12 500
EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 12 500
EXTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 13 1000
INTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $17.7800
EXT. PRICE $17,780.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 13 1000
INTERIOR SEMI-GLOSS,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG

BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE

2

GL
$16.0200
$8,010.00

2

GL
$19.2900
$19,290.00

BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

3

GL
$16.5000
$8,250.00

3

GL
$15.8600
$15,860.00

4

GL
$7.4300
$3,715.00

4

GL
$10.0700
$10,070.00

5
GL

$12.8800
$6,440.00

5
GL

$11.2100
$11,210.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 14 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR SEMI-
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 14 1000
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR SEMI-
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 15 500
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR GLOSS,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $18.5100
EXT. PRICE $9,255.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 15 500
INTERIOR/EXTERIOR GLOSS,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$12.5000 $19.4000 $10.2100
$12,500.00 $19,400.00 $10,210.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$16.0200 $21.0000 $11.3600
$8,010.00 $10,500.00 $5,680.00

5
GL

$11.3200
$11,320.00

5
GL

$16.6400
$8,320.00
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GROUP ITEM Qry

1 16 500
CEILING PAINT, FLAT LATEX.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $14.0600
EXT. PRICE $7,030.00
GROUFP ITEM Qry

1 16 500
CEILING PAINT, FLAT LATEX.
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 17 2000
TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

1 17 2000
TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$12.7500 $6.1000 $9.8000
$6,375.00 $3,050.00 $4,900.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$14.0500 $9.1000 $11.0800
$28,100.00 $18,200.00 $22,160.00

5
GL

$6.7700
$3,385.00

5
GL

$8.8800
$17,760.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTYy
1

18 1000
ATHLETIC FIELD STRIPING
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $8.3100
EXT. PRICE $8,310.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 18 1000
ATHLETIC FIELD STRIPING
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 19 500
ZONE MARKING PAINT. SEE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $15.0700
EXT. PRICE $7,535.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 19 500
ZONE MARKING PAINT. SEE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$10.7400 $6.7500 $4.9000
$10,740.00 $6,750.00 $4,900.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$14.0300 $9.1000 $12.9400
$7,015.00 $4,550.00 $6,470.00

5
GL

$22.2100
$22,210.00

5
GL

$13.6000
$6,800.00
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GROUP ITEM QrYy

1 20 500
PORCH & DECK, ACRYLIC
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $14.8200
EXT. PRICE $7.410.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 20 500
PORCH & DECK, ACRYLIC
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 21 500
EXTERIOR WOODSTAIN &
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $14.8200
EXT. PRICE $7,410.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 21 500
EXTERIOR WOODSTAIN &
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4
Y

GL GL GL
$22.7100 $0.0000 $17.1600
$11,355.00 $0.00 $8,580.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$17.1200 $14.0000 $14.0000
$8,560.00 $7.000.00 $7,000.00

5
GL

$12.7100
$6,355.00

5
GL

$20.8100
$10,405.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 22 500
METAL PRIMER, RED ALKYD,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $18.0900
EXT. PRICE $9,045.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 22 500
METAL PRIMER, RED ALKYD,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 23 500
METAL PRIMER, WHITE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $18.0900
EXT. PRICE $9,045.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 23 500
METAL PRIMER, WHITE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$28.9700 $17.0000 $8.2300
$14,485.00 $8,500.00 $4,115.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$24.0300 $17.0000 $17.7600
$12,015.00 $8,500.00 $8,880.00

5
GL

$17.2600
$8,630.00

5
GL

$18.4300
$9,215.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTyYy
1

24 500
RUST PREVENTATIVE,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $17.2900
EXT. PRICE $8,645.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 24 500
RUST PREVENTATIVE,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 25 1000
POLYURE THANE VARNISH,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $15.6900
EXT. PRICE $15,690.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 25 1000
POLYURE THANE VARNISH,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$24.2600 $23.0000 $22.3900
$12,130.00 $11,500.00 $11,195.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$20.1400 $22.2800 $18.2500
$20,140.00 $22,280.00 $18,250.00

5
GL

$18.3200
$9,160.00

5
GL

$12.7800
$12,780.00
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GROUP ITEM QTy

1 26 500
PRIMER, ACRYLIC,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $15.6900
EXT. PRICE $7,845.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 26 500
PRIMER, ACRYLIC,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 27 1000
SANDING SEALER, INTERIOR,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $13.9100
EXT. PRICE $13,910.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 27 1000
SANDING SEALER, INTERIOR,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$20.1400 $18.0000 $18.2500
$10,070.00 $9,000.00 $9,125.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$18.3600 $22.2800 $12.5900
$18,360.00 $22,280.00 $12,590.00

5
GL

$12.7100
$6,355.00

5
GL

$12.4300
$12,430.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTYy

1 28 1000
ACRYLIC PRIMER, RUST
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $15.8000
EXT. PRICE $15,800.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 28 1000
ACRYLIC PRIMER, RUST
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 29 500
UNDERCOATER, ACRYLIC
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $12.6900
EXT. PRICE $6,345.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 29 500
UNDERCOATER, ACRYLIC
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$23.3600 $18.5000 $19.6000
$23,360.00 $18,500.00 $19,600.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$19.7000 $16.5000 $14.4800
$9,850.00 $8,250.00 $7,240.00

5
GL

$16.2700
$16,270.00

5
GL

$10.3800
$5,190.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTYy

1 30 500
PRIMER, ACRYLIC,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $13.6200
EXT. PRICE $6,810.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 30 500
PRIMER, ACRYLIC,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 31 500
MULTI-PURPOSE PRIMER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 31 500
MULTI-PURPOSE PRIMER,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$22.4200 $17.0000 $11.1400
$11,210.00 $8,500.00 $5,570.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$17.7600 $16.5000 $14.4800
$8,880.00 $8,250.00 $7,240.00

5
GL

$12.7100
$6,355.00

5
GL

$13.8200
$6,910.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 32 1000
CONCRETE BLOCK FILLER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $10.4000
EXT. PRICE $10,400.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 32 1000
CONCRETE BLOCK FILLER,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 33 500
FINE TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 33 500
FINE TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$12.5500 $6.3500 $6.8500
$12,550.00 $6,350.00 $6,850.00

2 3 4

Y

GL GL GL
$18.5400 $0.0000 $10.4600
$9,270.00 $0.00 $5,230.00

5
GL

$5.9900
$5,990.00

5
GL

$14.5800
$7.290.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 34 500
MEDIUM TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 34 500
MEDIUM TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 35 1000
COURSE TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 35 1000
COURSE TEXTURE COATING,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4
Y
GL GL GL
$17.8000 $0.0000 $9.0000
$8,900.00 $0.00 $4,500.00
2 3 4
Y
GL GL GL
$17.8000 $0.0000 $10.4600
$17,800.00 $0.00 $10,460.00

5
GL

$10.8500
$5,425.00

5
GL

$11.3200
$11,320.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 1000
ELASTOMERIC SMOOTH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT $16.9500
EXT. PRICE $16,950.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 36 1000
ELASTOMERIC SMOOTH
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 37 1000
ELASTOMERIC WALL
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 37 1000
ELASTOMERIC WALL
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: {505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$18.5400 $16.5000 $11.2500
$18,540.00 $16,500.00 $11,250.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$20.6100 $16.5000 $11.2500
$20,610.00 $16,500.00 $11,250.00

5
GL

$14.7100
$14,710.00

5
GL

$11.7100
$11,710.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 38 500
EXTERIOR COATING,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 38 500
EXTERIOR COATING,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 39 500
EXTERIOR COATING,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU GL
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 39 500
EXTERIOR COATING,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4
Y
GL GL GL
$39.6000 $0.0000 $15.0900
$19,800.00 $0.00 $7.545.00
2 3 4
Y
GL GL GL
$41.8000 $0.0000 $15.0900
$20,900.00 $0.00 $7,545.00

5
GL

$50.0000
$25,000.00

5
GL

$50.0000
$25,000.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 40 500
MASONRY SEALER ,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $13.2000
EXT. PRICE $6,600.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 40 500
MASONRY SEALER
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT

EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 41 1000
MASONRY PRIMER/SEALER,
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT $11.4500
EXT. PRICE $11,450.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 41 1000
MASONRY PRIMER/SEALER,
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU GL
UNIT
EXT. PRICE $0.00

October 11, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-051-DG
BID TITLE: PAINT, PRIMER, VARNISH, SEALER AND MARKING PRODUCTS, COMMERCIAL GRADE
BID OPENING DATE: 10/10/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$19.5000 $11.9500 $8.6700
$9,750.00 $5,975.00 $4,335.00

2 3 4

GL GL GL
$13.3800 $13.1500 $11.0400
$13,380.00 $13,150.00 $11,040.00

5
GL

$10.3800
$5,190.00

5
GL

$10.3800
$10,380.00
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