CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

Inter-0Office Correspondence Reference No. RFB2005-119-WR

TO:
From:
Subject:

Title:

Bid Opening:

Requisition # 198763
Ronn Jones, Purchasing Officer
Wayne Riddle, Senior Buyer ﬁd\ww
Recommendation of Award on Re@uesr No RFR2005-119-WR

RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE & INSTALL LANDFILL GAS ENERGY SYSTEM (MICROTURBINE)

FOR THE ENVIRONMETAL HEALTH DEPARTMENT

03/16/05

I recommend awarding the following as the only responsive offer meeting specifications.

AWARDED TO ITEM DESCRIPTION BID PRICE TERMS
SCS ENERGY PROVIDE & INSTALL A LANDFILL GAS $198,000.00 NET
JEFFERY PIERCE, V P SYSTEM (MICROTURBINE)

3500 KILROY AIRPORT WAY #100

LONG BEACH, CA

90806-6816

NOTE: The Protest Period has been waived for this bid since it is a “Rapid Procurement”.

This 1s a Recommendation of Award, not an actual award. An actual award will be made by the
Purchasing Division by issuing a Purchase Order after the completion of the Recommendation

Award. Date of

Recommendation 3[30[05 .
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City of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE & INSTALL A LNADFILL GAS ENERGY SYSTEM
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 1 To ltem No.: 5
$198,000.00 $198,000.00 SCS ENERGY
SOLE BIDDER

Total Offers = 1

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

March 22, 2005 Page 1 of 1




Uity of Albugquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 SCS ENERGY

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1
RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $15,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $15,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $38,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $38,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE  $100,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $100,000.00

March 22, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE & INSTALL A LNADFILL GAS ENERGY SYSTEM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/11/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

Page 1 of 2



GROUP ITEM QTY
1 4 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $20,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $20,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 5 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $25,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $25,000.00

March 22, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE & INSTALL A LNADFILL GAS ENERGY SYSTEM

BID OPENING DATE: 3/11/2005

WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

Page 2 of 2



Uity of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

’ Response Vendor Preference
1 Number Name Type Delivery Notes
|

1 SCS ENERGY

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-119-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE & INSTALL A LNADFILL GAS ENERGY SYSTEM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/11/2005

WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 1 1
RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $15,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $15,000.00

GROUP  [TEM QTY
1 2 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $38,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $38,000.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 3 1
PLACE YOUR BID PRICE HERE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE  $100,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $100,000.00

March 22, 2005

Page 1 of 2




