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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JUNE 2, 2006
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, ACTING PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: 1R2E€_)CE_))(|;AMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006- BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006

TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS
THIS IS A REVISED RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD.

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1 GROUP 1 COMMUNITY CENTERS LEE LANDSCAPES $40,559.88 NET

5900 SIGNAL AVE NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87113

2 GROUP 2 POLICE SUBSTATIONS LEE LANDSCAPES $ 88,804.56 NET

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _ (g /7/0?..0

) / gooc.
JOHN J. 1L (DATE)
A 1ASING OFFICER

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAk AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY

APPROV




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II

OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To ltem 5
$0.00 $0.00 * A.C.T. ENTERPRISES
$33,046.50 $31,394.18 TRUGREEN
$40,559.88 $38,531.88 LEE SCAPES
$44,880.00 $42,636.00 DESERT GARDENS OUTDOOR SRV. INC
From Item No.: 6 To ltem 17
$69,579.00 $66,100.05 TRUGREEN
$88,804.56 $84,364.32 LEE SCAPES
$117,520.00 $111,644.00 DESERT GARDENS OUTDOOR SRV. INC
$230,890.00 $219,345.50 A.C.T. ENTERPRISES
Total Offers 8

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No

June 7, 2006
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM ||
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 TRUGREEN LOCAL BUSI
2 DESERT GARDENS OUTDOOR SRV. LOCAL BUSI
3 A.C.T. ENTERPRISES LOCAL BUSI
4 LEE SCAPES LOCAL BUSI
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 24
WEEKLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $547.0000 $700.0000 $0.0000 $721.8800
EXT. PRICE $13,128.00 $16,800.00 $0.00 $17,325.12
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 24
WEEKLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $345.0000 $550.0000 $0.0000 $637.0500
EXT. PRICE $8,280.00 $13,200.00 $0.00 $15,289.20
June 7, 2006
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 24
WEEKLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU MO
UNIT $409.0000
EXT. PRICE $9,816.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 15
IRRIGATION REPAIR ON AN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT $73.5000
EXT. PRICE $1,102.50
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 6
EMERGENCY RESPONSE TO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT $120.0000
EXT. PRICE $720.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 6 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU MO

UNIT $506.0000

EXT. PRICE $12,144.00
June 7, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3

Y

MO MO
$550.0000 $0.0000
$13,200.00 $0.00

2 3

Y

HR HR
$80.0000 $0.0000
$1,200.00 $0.00

2 3

Y

HR HR
$80.0000 $0.0000
$480.00 $0.00

2 3

MO MO
$850.0000 $1,200.0000
$20,400.00 $28,800.00

4

MO
$265.4400
$6,370.56

4

HR
$65.0000
$975.00

4

HR
$100.0000
$600.00

4

MO
$273.1900
$6,556.56
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 7 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $205.0000 $500.0000 $720.0000 $308.7500
EXT. PRICE $4,920.00 $12,000.00 $17,280.00 $7.410.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 8 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $403.0000 $450.0000 $1,200.0000 $425.4300
EXT. PRICE $9,672.00 $10,800.00 $28,800.00 $10,210.32
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 9 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $249.0000 $450.0000 $1,200.0000 $396.6800
EXT. PRICE $5,976.00 $10,800.00 $28,800.00 $9,520.32
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 10 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $139.0000 $300.0000 $480.0000 $300.0800
EXT. PRICE $3,336.00 $7,200.00 $11,520.00 $7,201.92
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 1 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $145.0000 $450.0000 $720.0000 $354.7500
EXT. PRICE $3,480.00 $10,800.00 $17,280.00 $8,514.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 12 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $77.0000 $250.0000 $480.0000 $308.7500
EXT. PRICE $1,848.00 $6,000.00 $11,520.00 $7,410.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 13 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $224.5000 $400.0000 $720.0000 $276.2500
EXT. PRICE $5,388.00 $9,600.00 $17,280.00 $6,630.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

2 14 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $497.0000 $650.0000 $1,440.0000 $581.2500
EXT. PRICE $11,928.00 $15,600.00 $34,560.00 $13,950.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-125-DG
BID TITLE: LANDSCAPING MAINTENANCE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP [TEM QTY

2 15 24
MONTHLY LANDSCAPING
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU MO MO MO MO
UNIT $403.0000 $550.0000 $1,440.0000 $431.3100
EXT. PRICE $9,672.00 $13,200.00 $34,560.00 $10,351.44
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 16 4
EMERGENCY RESPONSE TO
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $120.0000 $80.0000 $35.0000 $100.0000
EXT. PRICE $480.00 $320.00 $140.00 $400.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 17 10
IRRIGATION REPAIR AS
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU HR HR HR HR
UNIT $73.5000 $80.0000 $35.0000 $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $735.00 $800.00 $350.00 $650.00
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