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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MARCH 29, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
XY
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER

e

e

I

FROM:

o
mcm._mo._meOn@ZmZDb,jOZ OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-124-JR

puivey o
G

o Q
TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
st ] i

Ci et

BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007

| RECOMMEND BWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
_umm_umm%mm. APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: POLICE
85 B
ac VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
01-14 21,000 MEALS (EST.) MEALS FOR APD CADETS  ALBUQUERQUE CAFE INC. $9.35 $196,350.00 NET 30

4374 ALEXANDER BLVD. NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87107

ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:

. DATE OF RECOMMBENDATION: 29 MARCH 2007.

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. >ON%D_NM<W\EW MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
Wi
1 v

APPR :
B NMM\M\FL/V aw.ha\ 27—
e .m_.ou-m J. <_ﬁ >‘ “SMN_N (DATE)

wk&\ﬁ

(DATE)

CHIEF

POLICE



Item :

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM 1l
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-124-JR
BID TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3344

Bid Amount: Discounted Bid: Vendor Name/Comments:

From ltem No:

1

To Item: 14
$196,350.00 $186,532.50 ALBUQUERQUE CAFE INC.
$204,330.00 $194,113.50 NM COMISSION FOR THE BLIND
$213,150.00 $202,492.50 BLUE PLATE SPECIAL

$248,115.00 $235,709.25 GARDUNO'S ON THE GREEN

Total Offers 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'.

March 29, 2007

Page 1 of 1



AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM H
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number: Name: Type: Delivery Notes:

1 BLUE PLATE SPECIAL LOCAL BUSINESS  3/28/07

2 GARDUNO'S ON THE GREEN LOCAL BUSINESS  3/28/07

3 NM COMMISSION FOR THE BLIND LOCAL BUSINESS  3/27/07

4 ALBUQUERQUE CAFE INC. LOCAL BUSINESS  AS SPECIFIED BY APD

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-124-JR
BID TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3344
GROUP ITEM Qry
1 1 1500
MEAL 1 - TUKEY SANDWICH.
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $10.1500 $12.5900 $8.5300 $9.3500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00 $18,885.00 $12,795.00 $14,025.00
GROUP ITEM Qry
1 2 1500

MEAL 2 - CHICKEN CAESAR WRAP.
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT $10.1500 $10.6100 $8.5300 $9.3500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00 $15,915.00 $12,795.00 $14,025.00

March 29, 2007
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GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 3 1500
MEAL 3 - ITALIAN SUB.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

1 4 1500
MEAL 4 - ROAST BEEF GREEN CHILE CROISSANT.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

1 5 1500
MEAL 5 - PASTRAMI RUEBEN SANDWICH.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 6 1500
MEAL 6 - GREEN CHILE TURKEY WRAP.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00

March 29, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-124-JR
BID TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3344

2

EA
$11.4700
$17,205.00

2

EA
$11.3200
$16,980.00

2

EA
$12.0300
$18,045.00

2

EA
$11.6900
$17,535.00

3

EA
$8.5300
$12,795.00

3

EA
$8.5300
$12,795.00

3

EA
$8.5300
$12,795.00

3

EA
$8.5300
$12,795.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 7 1500
MEAL 7 - CLUB ON CROISSANT.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

1 8 1500
MEAL 8 - TUNA SALAD ON WHEAT BREAD.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 9 1500
MEAL 8 - CHICKEN SALAD SANDWICH.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM QrY

1 10 1500
MEAL 10 - ENCHILADAS.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00

March 29, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-124-JR
BID TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3344

2 3 4

EA EA EA
$12.5900 $8.5300 $9.3500
$18,885.00 $12,795.00 $14,025.00

2 3 4

EA EA EA
$9.4900 $8.5300 $9.3500
$14,235.00 $12,795.00 $14,025.00

2 3 4

EA EA EA
$10.2400 $8.5300 $9.3500
$15,360.00 $12,795.00 $14,025.00

2 3 4

EA EA EA
$12.5400 $11.6700 $9.3500
$18,810.00 $17,505.00 $14,025.00
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GROUP ITEM QrTy

1 11 1500
MEAL 11 - MEAT LASAGNA.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 12 1500
MEAL 12 - BBQ BRISKET.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 13 1500
MEAL 13 - GRILLED CHICKEN BREAST.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 14 1500
MEAL 14 - BEEF STROGANOFF.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT $10.1500
EXT. PRICE $15,225.00

March 29, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-124-JR
BID TITLE: CADET MEALS - FOOD SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
JOE RAEL, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3344

2

EA
$14.4100
$21,615.00

2

EA
$11.6100
$17,415.00

2

EA
$12.6100
$18,915.00

2

EA
$12.2100
$18,315.00

3

EA
$11.6700
$17,505.00

3

EA
$12.2200
$18,330.00

3

EA
$12.2200
$18,330.00

3

EA
$11.6700
$17,505.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00

4

EA
$9.3500
$14,025.00
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