ROA, RFB2006-105-GJ,

CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

TO: JOHN VIGIL, ACTING PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER
RFB2006-105-GJ

TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT

MAY 22, 2006

BID OPENING 3/22/2006

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY THE TRANSIT DEPARTMENT

ITEM

NO.  QUANTITY

ITEM

VENDOR

RECOMMENDED

FOR AWARD

UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS

DIESEL 1

DIESEL 2

BLEND

ULTRA LOW SULFUR

DIAL OIL COMPANY
EVERREADY OIL
PETROLEUM TRADERS

DIAL OIL COMPANY
EVERYREADY OIL
PETROLEUM TRADERS
AMIGO PETROLEUM

DIAL OIL COMPANY
EVERYREADY OIL
PETROLEUM TRADERS

DIAL OIL COMPANY
EVERYREADY OIL
AMIGO PETROLEUM



5 UNLEADED FUEL DIAL OIL COMPANY
EVERYREADY OIL
PETROLEUM TRADERS
AMIGO PETROLEUM

6 BIODIESEL (B60) EVERYREADY OIL
AMIGO PETROLEUM

7 BIODIESEL (B100) EVERYREADY OIL
AMIGO PETROLEUM

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVIS.IO&
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: __ (o' }.(9{> . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 5 OL@

APPIiC;\ﬁD AP?@D
Leclg\ (N~ 585-00 Vs Lopn~ S 250y
OHN NMIGIL (DATE) GRE'GPAYNE&IRECTOQ) (DATE)

ACTING PURCHASING OFFICER TRANSIT




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-105-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Vendor
From ltem 1 To item 1
$0.00 $0.00 * AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
$75.00 $75.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY
$500.00 $500.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$11,160.00 $11,160.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
From ltem 2 To item 2
$1,500.00 $1,500.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY
$10,000.00 $10,000.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$215,350.00 $215,350.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$226,200.00 $226,200.00 AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
From ltem 3 To tem 3
$0.00 $0.00 * AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
$75.00 $75.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY
$500.00 $500.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$11,782.00 $11,782.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
From ltem 4 To tem 4
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$75.00 $75.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY
$500.00 $500.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$11,360.00 $11,360.00 AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
From ltem 5 To ltem 5

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
May 22, 2006 Page 1 of 2



REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-105-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Vendor
$75.00 $75.00 DIAL OIL COMPANY
$500.00 $500.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$11,912.00 $11,912.00 PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$12,979.00 $12,979.00 AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
From ltem 6 To ltem 6
$0.00 $0.00  * DIAL OIL COMPANY
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$5,000.00 $5,000.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$123,690.00 $123,690.00 AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY
From Item 7 To ltem 7
$0.00 $0.00  * DIAL OIL COMPANY
$0.00 $0.00 * PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
$500.00 $500.00 EVER READY OIL CO.
$12,219.00 $12,219.00 AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No

May 22, 2006

Total Offers = 28
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |1
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Vendor Preferenc
Name eType Delivery

DIAL OIL COMPANY

AMIGO PETROLEUM COMPANY

PETROLEUM TRADERS WITHIN 24 HOURS AFTER ORDER

EVER READY OIL CO.

Respons
eNumber

1
2
3
4

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5000

DIESEL #1 PER THE TERMS

RESPONS 1

NO BID?

SKU GA

UNIT $0.0150

EXT. PRICE $75.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 10000

DIESEL #2 PER THE TERMS

RESPONS 1

NO BID?

SKU GA

UNIT $0.0150

EXT. PRICE $1,500.00

May 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-105-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
BID OPENING DATE: 3/22/2006
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3 4
Y

GA GA GA
$0.0000 $2.2320 $0.1000
$0.00 $11,160.00 $500.00

2 3 4

GA GA GA
$2.2620 $2.1535 $0.1000
$226,200.00 $215,350.00 $10,000.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-105-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
BID OPENING DATE: 3/22/2006
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 5000
BLEND PER THE TERMS AND
RESPONS 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y
SKU GA GA GA GA
UNIT $0.0150 $0.0000 $2.3564 $0.1000
EXT. PRICE $75.00 $0.00 $11,782.00 $500.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

4 5000
ULTRA LOW SULFUR PER
RESPONS 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y
SKU GA GA GA GA
UNIT $0.0150 $2.2720 $0.0000 $0.1000
EXT. PRICE $75.00 $11,360.00 $0.00 $500.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

5 5000
UNLEADED FUEL PER THE
RESPONS 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU GA GA GA GA
UNIT $0.0150 $2.5958 $2.3824 $0.1000
EXT. PRICE $75.00 $12,979.00 $11,912.00 $500.00
GROUP |ITEM QTy

6 50000
BIODIESEL (B60) PER
RESPONS 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y Y
SKU GA GA GA GA
UNIT $0.0000 $2.4738 $0.0000 $0.1000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $123,690.00 $0.00 $5,000.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-105-GJ
BID TITLE: DIESEL FUEL FOR TRANSIT
BID OPENING DATE: 3/22/2006
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

7 5000

(B100) PER ATTACHED

RESPONS 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y Y

SKU GA GA GA GA
UNIT $0.0000 $2.4438 $0.0000 $0.1000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $12,219.00 $0.00 $500.00
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