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ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

APRIL 2, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM:  KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR BID RFB2007132-KD

BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: FAMILY & COMMUNITY

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS

SEE TABULATION REPORT PRG

6050 S. VALLEY VIEW BLVD
LAS VEGAS, NV 89018

SEE TABULATION REPORT N30

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISICﬂI %Y‘\
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: ’\l 111071 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 07

Z S Tl 307
\_/Nﬁ %ﬁ[ ﬁ_/ (DATE) VALORIE VIGIL, DIRECTOR) (DATE)
PURCHASI FAMILY & COMMUNITY SERVICES




Item

City of Albugquergque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To tem No.: 19

$85,644.59
$92,231.62
$122,564.00

$85,644.59
$87,620.03
$122,564.00

PRG
HOGLES THEATRICAL
BARBIZON LIGHT

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was ‘No Bid'
Aprit 2, 2007

Total Offers = 3
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
BARBIZON LIGHT 4-6 WEEKS
PRG 21 DAYS
HOGLES THEATRICAL STATE BUSI 30 DAYS

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1

LIGHTING DESK (SEE PAGES 5

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.; (505) 768-3320

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $34,250.0000
EXT. PRICE $34,250.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

1 1
MEDIA SERVER (SEE PAGES 5
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $19,390.0000
EXT. PRICE $19,390.00

April 2, 2007

2 3

EA EA
$28,582.7700 $35,276.7000
$28,582.77 $35,276.70

2 3

EA EA
$15,725.1500 $20,096.7000
$15,725.15 $20,096.70
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GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 3 8
MOVING LIGHT FIXTURE (SEE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4,370.0000
EXT. PRICE $34,960.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 4 48
COLOR SCROLLERS (SEE PAG

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $322.0000
EXT. PRICE $15,456.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 48
20 FRAME SCROLL ( SEE PAGE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $57.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,736.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 6 36
SCROLL MOUNTING PLATE 7.5
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $160.0000

EXT. PRICE $5,760.00
April 2, 2007

EA
$1,547.5500
$12,380.40

EA
$344.5200
$16,536.96

EA
$45.9400
$2,205.12

EA
$15.6600
$563.76

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$1,349.9500
$10,799.60

EA
$302.6000
$14,524.80

EA
$48.7500
$2,388.00

EA
$15.6500
$563.40
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GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 7 438
SCROLLER MOUNTING PLATE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $16.0000
EXT. PRICE $768.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 6
SCROLLER POWER SUPPLY U

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $448.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,688.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 9 24
4- PIN SCROLLER CABLE &' (SE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $29.0000
EXT. PRICE $696.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 10 24
4-PIN SCROLLER CABLE 15 (S
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $35.0000

EXT. PRICE $840.00
April 2, 2007

EA
$15.6600
$751.68

EA
$462.1400
$2,772.84

EA
$22.6400
$543.36

$28.1900
$676.56

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$407 9500
$2,447.70

$25.7500
$618.00

EA
$30.3000
$727.20
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GROUP ITEM Q1Y
1 11 24
4- PIN SCROLLER CABLE 25' (S

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $42.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,008.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 12 8
4-PIN SCROLLER CABLE 50" (S
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $58.0000
EXT. PRICE $464.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 13 2
17" TOUCH SCREEN MONITOR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $688.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,376.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 14 1
17" LCD MONITOR (SEE PAGES

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $228.0000

EXT. PRICE $228.00
April 2, 2007

EA
$33.3400
$800.16

$46.2300
$369.84

EA
$664.4600
$1,328.92

EA
$243.1500
$243.15

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$34.1000
$818.40

EA
$44.4900
$355.92

$750.0000
$1,500.00

$325.0000
$325.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 15 2
DMX S-PIN OPTO-ISOLATOR (S

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $373.0000
EXT. PRICE $746.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 16 2
5-PIN DATA CABLE 150' (SEE P
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $128.0000
EXT. PRICE $256.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 17 6
5-PIN DATA CABLE 50' (SEE PA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $61.0000
EXT. PRICE $366.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 18 12

3-PIN DATA CABLE 20' (SEE PA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $34.0000
EXT. PRICE $408.00

April 2, 2007

$654.2400
$1,308.48

EA
$101.1300
$202.26

EA
$41.7700
$250.62

EA
$22.8800
$274.56

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

$410.0000
$820.00

$87.1000
$174.20

EA
$46.6000
$279.60

$26.3000
$315.60
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. REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-132-KD
BID TITLE: LIGHTING SYSTEM - VSA ARTS NM
BID OPENING DATE: 3/28/2007

KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyY

1 19 8

3-PiN FEMALE TO 5-PIN MALE

RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?

SKU EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $21.0000 $16.0000 $25.1000
EXT. PRICE $168.00 $128.00 $200.80

April 2, 2007
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