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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MARCH 15, 2006

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006-113-KD BID OPENING DATE: 2/22/2006

TITLE: RFB- CONCRETE AND GROUT PUMPING

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: MUNICIPAL DEVELOPMENT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT TERMS
1-5 CONCRETE AND GROUT PUMPING  J.R. GUTIERREZ INC. $26,920.00 N 30

dba GUTIERREZ GROUT PUMPING

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISIO
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: (5 &/L/’ (Jlg . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: _ 3 7/ Jlp

3 LA
Joh J V,LGIL (DATE)
(_ASSIST OFFICER




City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERR LOCAL BUSI AS NEEDED
2 SUNWEST GUNITE CO. LOCAL BUSI AS NEEDED

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 100
HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE (O

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU . HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 100
HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE (O

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,500.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 68
HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE (
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $95.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,460.00

March 15, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-113-KD
BID TITLE: RFB- CONCRETE AND GROUT PUMPING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/22/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

HR
$100.0000
$10,000.00

HR
$100.0000
$10,000.00

HR
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

4 68
HOURLY RATE TO PROVIDE (O
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $95.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,460.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 500
PRICE PER YARD FOR CONCR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YD
UNIT PRICE $2.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,000.00

March 15, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-113-KD
BID TITLE: RFB- CONCRETE AND GROUT PUMPING
BID OPENING DATE: 2/22/2006
KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

HR
$0.0000
$0.00

YD
$10.0000
$5,000.00
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Uity of Albuquergque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-113-KD
BID TITLE: RFB- CONCRETE AND GROUT PUMPING

KELLI DEANGELIS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: To Item No.:
$6,500.00 $6,175.00 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERREZ CONCRETE PUMPI
$10,000.00 $9,500.00 SUNWEST GUNITE CO.
From ftem No.; To Item No.:
$6,500.00 $6,175.00 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERREZ CONCRETE PUMPI
$10,000.00 $9,500.00 SUNWEST GUNITE CO.
From Item No.: To Item No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * SUNWEST GUNITE CO.
$6,460.00 $6,137.00 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERREZ CONCRETE PUMPI
From Item No.: To Item No.:
$0.00 $0.00 * SUNWEST GUNITE CO.
$6,460.00 $6,137.00 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERREZ CONCRETE PUMPI
From Item No.: To item No.:
$1,000.00 $950.00 J.R. GUTIERREZ INC., DBA GUTIERREZ CONCRETE PUMPI
$5,000.00 $4,750.00 SUNWEST GUNITE CO.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No Bid'

March 15, 2006

Total Offers= 10

Page 1 of 1



