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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

SEPTEMBER 22, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGE
FROM: BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER y
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007-

025-BH

TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE

BID OPENING DATE: 9/20/2007

PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: WATER UTILITY

VENDOR

ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL

NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT
1 200/CS 12 EA. CONTAINERS, 1000 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 80.00 $ 8,000.00
2 100/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 500 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 92.50 $ 4,625.00
3 24/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 2000MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 18.07 $ 433.68
4 44/CS 12 EA CONTAINERS, 500 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 12.44 $ 547.36
5 88/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 250 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 8.87 $ 780.56
6 60/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 250 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 6.49 $ 778.80
7 75/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 250 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 12.98 $ 973.50
8 150/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 500 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 20.26 $ 3,039.00
9 140/CS 12 EA CONTAINERS, 1000 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 35.96 $ 2,517.20
10 87/CS 20 EA CONTAINERS, 1000 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 25.09 $ 2,182.83
11 4/CS 12 EA CONTAINERS, 500 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 28.00 $ 56.00
12 40/CS 12 EA CONTAINERS, 250 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 10.51 $ 42040
13 10/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 125 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 35.84 $ 179.20
14 50/CS 24 EA CONTAINERS, 1000 MIL FOX SCIENTIFIC $ 56.60 $ 1,415.00




THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_¢# (o) /O 3 /O { . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: /©

- APPR( D: , .
S o Ly T,
¥ (DATE)

(:.‘2
}’ ROY ROBINSON, DIRECTOR (DATE)
ANAGER WATER UTILITY/ < *



City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM II
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response
Number

Vendor Preference
Name Type Delivery Notes

ARMSTRONG MEDICAL INDUSTRIES |

FOX SCIENTIFIC

RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES STATE BUSI

A. DAIGGER & COMPANY, INC.

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 1 100
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 50
PRICE PER CASE OF 48 EACH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Ccs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

September 22, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-025-BH
BID TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS
BID OPENING DATE: 9/20/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2 3
cs cs
$80.0000 $89.0000
$8,000.00 $8,900.00
2 3
Ccs cs
$92.5000 $110.0000
$4,625.00 $5,500.00

cs
$87.8800
$8,788.00

Ccs
$106.3600
$5,318.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 24
PRICE PER CASE OF 12 EACH

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM  QTY
1 4 44
PRICE PER CASE OF 12 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 44
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 6 120
PRICE PER CASE OF 12 EA SA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

September 22, 2006

Cs
$18.0700
$433.68

CS
$12.4400
$547.36

Ccs
$8.8700
$390.28

Cs
$6.4900
$778.80

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-025-BH
BID TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS
BID OPENING DATE: 9/20/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

Cs
$41.0000
$984.00

Cs
$21.0000
$924.00

Ccs
$16.0000
$704.00

Ccs
$28.0000
$3,360.00

Cs
$25.2600
$606.24

CS
$19.6200
$863.28

Cs
$16.1700
$711.48

CS
$114.0500
$13,686.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 7 75
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 150
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 9 70
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EACH

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 10 145
PRICE PER CASE OF 123A SA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

September 22, 2006

cs
$12.9800
$973.50

Cs
$20.2600
$3,039.00

Cs
$35.9600
$2,517.20

cs
$12.5450
$1,819.03

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-025-BH
BID TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS
BID OPENING DATE: 9/20/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

cs
$28.0000
$2,100.00

Cs
$15.0000
$2,250.00

Cs
$15.0000
$1,050.00

cs
$40.0000
$5,800.00

cs
$112.3700
$8,427.75

(o]
$89.6500
$13,447.50

cs
$63.0400
$4,412.80

cs
$30.1400
$4,370.30
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 11 2
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 12 20
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 13 5
PRICE PER CASE OF 48 EA SA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU CSs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 14 25
PRICE PER CASE OF 24 EA SA
RESPONSE 1
NO BID? Y
SKU Cs
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

September 22, 2006

(033
$28.0000
$56.00

Cs
$21.0200
$420.40

Cs
$35.8400
$179.20

CSs
$56.6000
$1,415.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-025-BH
BID TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS
BID OPENING DATE: 9/20/2007
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

Cs
$60.0000
$120.00

Cs
$70.0000
$1,400.00

Cs
$90.0000
$450.00

Cs
$90.0000
$2,250.00

Cs
$58.3200
$116.64

(033
$28.6300
$572.60

Cs
$68.9900
$344.95

Cs
$68.3300
$1,708.25
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City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-025-BH
BID TITLE: EPA CERTIFIED SAMPLE CONTAINERS
BERNICE HUGHES, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From item No.: 1 To ltem No.: 14
$0.00 $0.00  * ARMSTRONG MEDICAL INDUSTRIES INC.
$25,194.44 $25,194.44 FOX SCIENTIFIC
$35,792.00 $34,002.40 RICHARDS TECHNOLOGIES
$63,373.79 $63,373.79 A. DAIGGER & COMPANY, INC.

Total Offers = 4

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid’

September 22, 2006 Page 1 of 1



