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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

AUGUST 1, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008- BID OPENING DATE: 7/4/2007
007-GJ :

TITLE: 40 CY RECYCLING BINS, 30 CUBIC YARD OPEN TOPS

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 40CU YD RECYCLING BINS BRAVO SALES
30CU YD OPEN TOPS PO BOX 7217
6 CU YD CONTAINERS ALBUQUERQUE NM 87104 $607,485.00

4 CU YD CONTAINERS
LIDS FOR6 CU YD
LIDS FOR 2 CU YD SWANSONS

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION B
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:
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JMIGW (DATE) LEONARD GARCIA, DIRECTOR (DATE)
PURCHASIN AGER SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT




Item

City of Albugquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-007-GJ
BID TITLE: 40 CY RECYCLING BINS, 30 CUBIC YARD OPEN TOPS
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From Item No.:

1

To ltem No.:

6

$607,485.00 $577,110.75 BRAVO SALES

$636,180.00 $636,180.00 ACTION CONTAINER

$694,020.00 $659,319.00 ALL AMERICAN WASTE

$704,955.00 $704,955.00 ROCKY MOUNTAIN WELDING & FAB
$712,284.50 $712,284.50 STEELFORM INDUSTRIES

Total Offers = 5

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

August 1, 2007
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City of Albuguerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes

ROCKY MOUNTAIN WELDING & FAB

60 DAYS FORM ORDER DATE

STEELFORM INDUSTRIES 45 DAYS ARO
ACTION CONTAINER 60 DAYS

ALL AMERICAN WASTE LOCAL MANU

BRAVO SALES LOCAL MANU 30 DAYS AO

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 1 20
40 CUBIC YARD RECYCLING BI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $6,145.0000
EXT. PRICE $122,900.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 140
30 CUBIC YARD OPEN TOPS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $3,636.0000
EXT. PRICE $509,040.00

August 1, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-007-GJ
BID TITLE: 40 CY RECYCLING BINS, 30 CUBIC YARD OPEN TOPS
BID OPENING DATE: 7/4/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

YR
$5,765.0000
$115,300.00

YR
$3,650.0000
$511,000.00

YR
$4,748.0000
$94,960.00

YR
$3,275.0000
$458,500.00

$6,490.0000
$129,800.00

$3,548.0000
$496,720.00

YR
$4,963.0000
$99,260.00

YR
$3,149.0000
$440,860.00
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GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 3 40
SIX (6) CUBIC YARD CONTAIN

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $770.0000
EXT. PRICE $30,800.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 40
4 CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $549.0000
EXT. PRICE $21,960.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 800
LIDS FOR 6 CUBIC YARD CON
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $21.4000
EXT. PRICE $17,120.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 6 150
LIDS FOR 2 YARD SWANSONS
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU YR
UNIT PRICE $20.9000
EXT. PRICE $3,135.00

August 1, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-007-GJ
BID TITLE: 40 CY RECYCLING BINS, 30 CUBIC YARD OPEN TOPS
BID OPENING DATE: 7/4/2007
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

YR
$798.0000
$31,920.00

YR
$537.0000
$21,480.00

YR
$34.8900
$27,912.00

YR
$31.1500
$4,672.50

YR
$738.0000
$29,520.00

YR
$510.0000
$20,400.00

YR
$27.5000
$22,000.00

YR
$72.0000
$10,800.00

YR
$690.0000
$27,600.00

YR
$550.0000
$22,000.00

YR
$19.0000
$15,200.00

YR
$18.0000
$2,700.00

YR
$627.0000
$25,080.00

YR
$457.0000
$18,280.00

YR
$25.9000
$20,720.00

YR
$21.9000
$3,285.00
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