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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 11, 2006

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2007- BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006
075-DG

TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: MUNICIPAL DEVELOPMENT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
1 1 SYSTEM GNSS SYSTSTEM PER SPECS HOLMAN'S INC. $138,000.00 NET

6201 JEFFERSON ST NE
ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87109

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION B
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:_/2)27 [¢)lp . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: ;<2]) 9/0(p
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Item

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I!
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-075-DG
BID TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To item 13

$138,000.00 $131,100.00 HOLMANS, INC.

$218,035.00 $218,035.00 SURVEYORS SERVICE CO.
DISQUALIFIED. INVALID BID BOND.

$467,178.50 $467,178.50  * TRIMBLE NAVIGATION LTD

DISQUALIFIED. NO BID BOND.

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
December 19, 2006

Total Offers 3
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM If
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 TRIMBLE NAVIGATION LTD
2 SURVEYORS SERVICE CO. 30 DAYS ARO
3 HOLMANS, INC. STATE BUSI
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-075-DG
BID TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK
BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 1 5
GNSS GEODETIC QUALITY
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT $20,995.0000 $0.0000 $9,221.0000
EXT. PRICE $104,975.00 $0.00 $46,105.00
GROUP  |ITEM QTY
1 2 6
GNSS GEODETIC QUALITY
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT $2,895.0000 $3,835.0000
EXT. PRICE $17,370.00 $0.00 $23,010.00

December 11, 2006
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GROUP  ITEM QTyYy

1 3 1
GNSS ROVER RECEIVER
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $23,420.0000
EXT. PRICE $23,420.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 4 1
GNSS ROVER ANTENNA. SEE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00

GROUP ITEM Qry
1 5 1
GNSS FIELD CONTROLLER.

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $5,915.0000
EXT. PRICE $5,915.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 6 2
IDENTICAL SERVER
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $17,500.0000
EXT. PRICE $35,000.00

December 11, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-075-DG
BID TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK
BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

EA
$12,071.0000
$12,071.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

EA
$2,234.0000
$2,234.00

3

EA
$4,510.0000
$9,020.00
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GROUP  ITEM

1

QTy
1

HARDWARE MAINTENANCE &

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $4,895.0000
EXT. PRICE $4,895.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 1
NETWORK SOFTWARE.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $73,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $73,000.00
GROUP  ITEM Qry

1

1

ANCILLARY SOFTWARE. SEE

RESPONSE

NO BID?

SKU

UNIT

EXT. PRICE
GROUP  ITEM

1

1

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

QTY
1

SYSTEM DELIVERY.

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT

EXT. PRICE

1

EA
$2,500.0000
$2,500.00

December 11, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-075-DG
BID TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK
BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

EA
$9,253.0000
$9,253.00

3

EA
$20.060.0000
$20,060.00

3

EA
$1,162.0000
$1,162.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00
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GROUP  {TEM QTY
1 11 1

SYSTEM INSTALLATION. SEE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $125,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $125,000.00
GROUP ITEM Qry

1 12 1
ONGOING MAINTENANCE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $69,103.5000
EXT. PRICE $69,103.50
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 13 1
TRAINING AS REQUESTED IN
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $6,000.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,000.00

December 11, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2007-075-DG
BID TITLE: REAL TIME G.N.S.S. NETWORK
BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$218,035.0000
$218,035.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

EA
$7,080.0000
$7,080.00

3

EA
$5,664.0000
$5,664.00

3

EA
$2,341.0000
$2,341.00
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