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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

JANUARY 86, 2005
TO:! RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: i'}}{:)DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON RFB2005- BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
074-DG
TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
TEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY [TEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT  AMOUNT TERMS
GROUP 1 800 EA VARIOUS BADGES AND LAPEL PINS RAY O'HERRON CO. VARIES $22,267.10 NET
25 ITEMS 3549 N VERMILION ST,
DANVILLE, IL 81834-1070
GROUP 2 500 EA VARIOUS BADGES FIRST IN VARIES  $14,213.00 NET
11 ITEMS 3720 HAWKINS NE

ALBUQUERQUE, NM 87109

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL A
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:  1/14/0

APPED: w \
fe cea? £’ }éf///é%‘

RONN D. JONES DATE)
PURCHASING OFFICER

WARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVJS
; . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: i/(?ydag




Item

Uity of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To ltem No.: 25
$0.00 $0.00 * OGS TECHNOLOGIES
$0.00 $0.00 * C&H METALCRAFTS
$22,267.10 $22,267.10 RAY O'HERRON COMPANY
$24,253.50 $23,040.83 FIRST INC.
$23,879.59 $23,879.59 GT DISTRIBUTORS INC.
$29,704.00 $28,218.80 FIRE SERVICE EQUIPMENT LLC
From item No.. 26 To ltem No.: 38
$12,700.00 $12,065.00 FIRST INC.
$14,198.00 $14,198.00 RAY O'HERRON COMPANY
$15,460.00 $14,687.00 * C&H METALCRAFTS
$14,927.70 $14,927.70 GT DISTRIBUTORS INC.
$30,030.00 $28,528.50 FIRE SERVICE EQUIPMENT LLC
$33,680.00 $33,680.00 OGS TECHNOLOGIES

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'

December 29, 2004

Total Offers = 12
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Uity of Albugquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
RAY O'HERRON COMPANY 3-6 WEEKS
OGS TECHNOLOGIES 03-01-2005
C&H METALCRAFTS LOCAL BUSI
GT DISTRIBUTORS INC. 30 DAYS ARO
FIRST INC. LOCAL BUSI 45 DAYS ARO
FIRE SERVICE EQUIPMENT LLC LOCAL BUSI 30-45 DAYS

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1
FIRE DEPARTMENT BADGES -

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $32.80

GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 1 1
FIRE DEPARTMENT BADGES -

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.0000
EXT. PRICE $32.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$35.64

EA
$36.0000
$36.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 2 4
BREAST BADGE - DEPUTY CHI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $131.20

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 2 4
BREAST BADGE - DEPUTY CHI

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $112.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 12
BREAST BADGE - COMMANDE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $393.60

GROUP ITEM QTYy
1 3 12
BREAST BADGE - COMMANDE

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $336.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$142.56

EA
$35.6400
$427.68

EA
$36.0000
$144.00

EA
$36.0000
$432.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 20
BREAST BADGE - CAPTAIN; H
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $656.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 4 20
BREAST BADGE - CAPTAIN; H

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $560.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 5 50
BREAST BADGE - LIEUTENANT

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $1,640.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 5 50
BREAST BADGE - LIEUTENANT

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,400.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$§712.80

EA
$35.6400
$1,782.00

EA
$36.0000
$720.00

EA
$36.0000
$1,800.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 6 15
BREAST ABADGE, PARAMEDI
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $492.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 6 15
BREAST ABADGE, PARAMEDI

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $420.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 7 30
BREAST BADGE - DRIVER PAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $984.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 7 30
BREAST BADGE - DRIVER PAR

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $840.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$534.60

EA
$35.6400
$1,069.20

EA
$36.0000
$540.00

EA
$36.0000
$1,080.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 8 60
BREAST BADGE - DRIVER SUP
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $1,968.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 8 60
BREAST BADGE - DRIVER SUP

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,680.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 9 15
BREAST BADGE - INSPECTOR;

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $492.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 9 15
BREAST BADGE - INSPECTOR;
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $420.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$2,138.40

EA
$35.6400
$534.60

EA
$36.0000
$2,160.00

EA
$36.0000
$540.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 10 120
BREAST BADGE - FIRE FIGHTE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $3,936.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
1 10 120
BREAST BADGE - FIRE FIGHTE

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,360.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 " 60
BREAST BADGE - DISPATCHE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $32.8000
EXT. PRICE $1,968.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 " 60
BREAST BADGE - DISPATCHE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,680.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$35.6400
$4,276.80

EA
$35.6400
$2,138.40

EA
$36.0000
$4,320.00

EA
$36.0000
$2,160.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
1 12 1
CAP BADGE - FIRE CHIEF, HG,

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $19.5000
EXT. PRICE $19.50

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 12 1
CAP BADGE - FIRE CHIEF; HG,

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000
EXT. PRICE $35.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 13 4
CAP BADGE - DEPUTY CHIEF;
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $19.5000
EXT. PRICE $78.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 13 4
CAP BADGE - DEPUTY CHIEF;
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000
EXT. PRICE $140.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$21.4700
$21.47

EA
$21.4700
$85.88

EA
$22.0000
$22.00

EA
$22.0000
$88.00
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GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 14

CAP BADGE - COMMANDER; H

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

10

1

EA
$19.5000
$195.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 14

CAP BADGE - COMMANDER; H

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

10

6

EA
$17.0000
$170.00

GROUP  ITEM QTyY

1 15

CAP BADGE - CAPTAIN; HG; A1

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

15

1

EA
$14.5000
$217.50

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 15

CAP BADGE - CAPTAIN; HG; A1

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

December 29, 2004

15

6

EA
$29.0000
$435.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS,
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

< N

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$21.4700
$214.70

EA
$15.3800
$230.70

EA
$22.0000
$220.00

EA
$15.5000
$232.50
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 16 50
CAP BADGE - LIEUTENANT; NP
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $11.6000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $11.6600
EXT. PRICE $580.00 $0.00 $0.00 $583.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 16 50
CAP BADGE - LIEUTENANT; NP
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $20.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,000.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 17 120
CAP BADGE - DRIVER SUPPRE
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $15.9000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $17.1700
EXT. PRICE $1,908.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,060.40

GROUP ITEM QTy
1 17 120
CAP BADGE - DRIVER SUPPRE

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000
EXT. PRICE $4,200.00

December 29, 2004

EA
$11.5000
$575.00

EA
$17.5000
$2,100.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 18 200
CAP BADGE - FIRE FIGHTER,
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $15.9000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $17.1700 $17.5000
EXT. PRICE $3,180.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,434.00 $3,500.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 18 200
CAP BADGE - FIRE FIGHTER,;
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000
EXT. PRICE $7,000.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 19 4
LAPEL BUTTONS - FIRE CHIEF;
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID? Y Y
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $6.5000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $6.9800 $7.0000
EXT. PRICE $26.00 $0.00 $0.00 $27.92 $28.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY

1 19 4
LAPEL BUTTONS - FIRE CHIEF;
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $12.0000
EXT. PRICE $48.00

December 29, 2004 Page 10 of 20




GROUP ITEM QTY

1 20 8
LAPEL BUTTONS - DEPUTY CH
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $6.5000
EXT. PRICE $52.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 20 8
LAPEL BUTTONS - DEPUTY CH

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $17.0000
EXT. PRICE $136.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 21 20
LAPEL BUTTON - COMMONAD

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $6.5000
EXT. PRICE $130.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 21 20
LAPEL BUTTON - COMMONAD
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $10.0000
EXT. PRICE $200.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$6.9800
$55.84

EA
$6.9800
$139.60

EA
$7.0000
$56.00

EA
$7.0000
$140.00
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GROUP ITEM
1 22

QTY
30

LAPEL BUTTON - CAPTAIN; HG

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP  ITEM
1 22

1

EA
$6.5000
$195.00

QTY
30

LAPEL BUTTON - CAPTAIN; HG

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM
1 23

6

EA
$10.0000
$300.00

QTY
80

LAPEL BUTTON - LIEUTENANT;

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4.7500
EXT. PRICE $380.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 23 80
LAPEL BUTTON - LIEUTENANT;
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $10.0000
EXT. PRICE $800.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$6.9800
$209.40

EA
$4.8000
$384.00

EA
$7.0000
$210.00

EA
$5.0000
$400.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 24 250
LAPEL BUTTON - DRIVER SUP
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4.7500
EXT. PRICE $1,187.50
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 24 250
LAPEL BUTTON - DRIVER SUP
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $8.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,000.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

1 25 300

LAPEL BUTTON - FIRE FIGHTE

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4.7500
EXT. PRICE $1,425.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 25 300
LAPEL BUTTON - FIRE FIGHTE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $8.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,400.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.

DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (5058) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

< N

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004

3

Y

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$4.8000
$1,200.00

EA
$4.8000
$1,440.00

EA
$5.0000
$1,250.00

EA
$5.0000
$1,500.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

2 26 100
POLICE BADGES - BLACKING
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $24.5000
EXT. PRICE $2,450.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

2 26 100
POLICE BADGES - BLACKING
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $55.0000
EXT. PRICE $5,500.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

2 27 100
VHB A6231 CAP BADGE
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.5000
EXT. PRICE $2,150.00
GROUP ITEM QTyYy

2 27 100
VHB A6231 CAP BADGE
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $55.0000
EXT. PRICE $5,500.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$70.0000
$7,000.00

EA
$55.0000
$5,500.00

EA
$30.0000
$3,000.00

EA
$28.0000
$2,800.00

EA
$25.0000
$2,500.00

EA
$21.1500
$2,115.00

EA
$25.5000
$2,550.00

EA
$21.5000
$2,150.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

2 28 40
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1766 BR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $30.2500
EXT. PRICE $1,210.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 28 40
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1766 BR

RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,600.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
2 29 100
GOLD ALLOY: VHB A6231 CA

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $23.2500
EXT. PRICE $2,325.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 28 100
GOLD ALLOY: VHB A6231 CA
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $55.0000
EXT. PRICE $5,500.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$68.0000
$2,720.00

EA
$55.0000
$5,500.00

EA
$30.0000
$1,200.00

EA
$28.0000
$2,800.00

EA
$32.3700
$1,294.80

EA
$23.3900
$2,339.00

EA
$33.0000
$1,320.00

EA
$3.5000
$350.00
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GROUP ITEM
2 30
DELETE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM
2 30
DELETE

RESPONSE
NO BID?
SKU

UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE

GROUP ITEM
2 31

QTY

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

QTY
1

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

QTY
50

GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1548 BR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $26.2500
EXT. PRICE $1,312.50
GROUP ITEM  QTY

2 31 50
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1548 BR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,250.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$65.0000
$3,250.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$30.0000
$1,500.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$27.2400
$1,362.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$27.5000
$1,375.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 32 1
DELETE ITEM
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 32 1
DELETE ITEM
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $0.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 33 20
FIELD EVIDENCE TECH BADG
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $35.0000 $70.0000 $30.0000 $38.4600 $17.0000
EXT. PRICE $700.00 $1,400.00 $600.00 $769.20 $340.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 33 20
FIELD EVIDENCE TECH BADG
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.0000
EXT. PRICE $420.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 34 20
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B2171BR
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $26.2500 $70.0000 $30.0000 $27.2400 $27.5000
EXT. PRICE $525.00 $1,400.00 $600.00 $544.80 $550.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 34 20
GOLD ALLOY:  VHB B2171 BR
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $63.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,260.00
GROUP ITEM QTY
2 35 20
GOLD ALLOY: VHB A6231 CA
RESPONSE 1 2 3 4 5
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $23.2500 $55.0000 $28.0000 $23.3900 $23.5000
EXT. PRICE $465.00 $1,100.00 $560.00 $467.80 $470.00
GROUP  ITEM QTY
2 35 20
GOLD ALLOY: VHB AB231 CA
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $55.0000
EXT. PRICE $1,100.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

2 36 70
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1548 RET
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $26.2500
EXT. PRICE $1,837.50

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 36 70
GOLD ALLOY: VHB B1548 RET
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $62.0000
EXT. PRICE $4,340.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 37 20
REPAIRS TO BADGES NOT CO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $21.2500
EXT. PRICE $425.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 37 20
REPAIRS TO BADGES NOT CO
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $28.0000
EXT. PRICE $560.00

December 29, 2004

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$65.0000
$4,550.00

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$30.0000
$2,100.00

EA
$15.0000
$300.00

EA
$27.2400
$1,906.80

EA
$23.0700
$461.40

EA
$27.5000
$1,925.00

EA
$24.0000
$480.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

2 38 70
#2 CASE FOR RETIRED B1548
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $11.4000
EXT. PRICE $798.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY

2 38 70
#2 CASE FOR RETIRED B1548
RESPONSE 6
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT PRICE
EXT. PRICE $0.00

December 29, 2004

EA
$18.0000
$1,260.00

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-074-DG
BID TITLE: BADGES FOR POLICE AND FIRE DEPTS.
BID OPENING DATE: 12/29/2004
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$0.0000
$0.00

EA
$16.6700
$1,166.90

EA
$17.0000
$1,190.00
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