Inter-0Office Correspondence Reference No. RFB2005-188-WR
July 27, 2005
Requisition # P37074
TO: Ronn Jones, Purchasing Officer
From: Wayne Riddle, Senior Buyer S
Subject: Recommendation of Award on Reguest No. RFB2005-188-WR
Title: RAPID PROCUREMENT TO PROVIDE POOL EQUIPMENT FOR THE PARKS & RECREATION DEPT.,

AQUATICS DIVISION
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ITEM DESCRIPTION BID PRICE
EONICS, INC #1 STARTING PLATFORM 1,275.00 NET

HARTNET, SALES DES FREIGHT)
4200 SCHMITT AVE.
LOUISVILLE, KY 40213
MULT #2-4 DIVING BOARRDS & STANDS $18,242.91 1% 20 DAYS, NET
C Y, V.P. (INCLUDES FREIGHT)
995 L RD
ROSWE A 30076

NOTE: The Protest Period has been waived for this bid since it is a “Rapid Procurement”.

This 1s a Recommendatiocn of Award, not an actual award. An actual award will be made by the
Purchasing Division by issuing a Purchase Order after the completion of the Recommendation
Award. Date of Recommendation N/A .
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Jay Hart (Date)
Director, Parks & Recreation Dept.




City of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-188-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF POOL EQUIPMENT
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.. 1 To ltem No.: 1
$11,275.00 $11,275.00 RECREONICS, INC.
$13,190.00 $13,190.00 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC.
$13,738.60 $13,738.60 MULTITECH
From ltem No.: 2 To ltem No.: 2
$5,012.00 $5,012.00 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC.
$5,108.50 $5,108.50 MULTITECH
$5,125.64 35,125.64 RECREONICS, INC.
From ftem No.: 3 To ltem No.: 3
$3,926.25 $3,826.25 MULTITECH
$4,039.00 $4,039.00 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC.
$4,200.89 $4,200.89 RECREONICS, INC.
From ltem No.. 4 Toltem No.: 4
$9,208.16 $9,208.16 MULTITECH
$9,279.00 $9,278.00 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC.
$9,690.59 $9,690.59 RECREONICS. INC.

Total Offers = 12

July 1, 2005
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Uity of Albuquerque

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC.
2 RECREONICS, INC. 21-35 DAYS
3 MULTITECH 6-8 WEEKS
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-188-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF POOL EQUIPMENT
BID OPENING DATE: 6/23/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTY
1 10
STARTING PLATFORM WITH A
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $1,319.0000 $1,127.5000 $1,373.8600
EXT. PRICE $13,190.00 $11,275.00 $13,738.60
GROUP  ITEM Q7Y
2 2
16' DIVING BOARD("CHEESE B
RESPONSE 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT PRICE $2,506.0000 $2,562.8200 $2,554.2500
EXT. PRICE $5,012.00 $5,125.64 $5,108.50
July 1, 2005
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GROUP  ITEM QTY
3 1
SHORT STAND , WITH DOUBL

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU EA
UNIT PRICE $4,039.0000
EXT. PRICE $4,039.00

GROUP  ITEM QTY
4 1
3 METER DIVING STAND WITH

RESPONSE 1

NO BID?

SKU EA

UNIT PRICE $9,279.0000

EXT. PRICE $9,279.00
July 1, 2005

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2005-188-WR
BID TITLE: RAPID PROCUREMENT OF POOL EQUIPMENT
BID OPENING DATE: 6/23/2005
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

EA
$4,200.8900
$4,200.89

EA
$9,690.5900
$9,690.59

EA
$3,926.2500
$3,926.25

EA
$9,208.1600
$9,208.16
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TABULATION FOR RFB2005-188-WR- RAPID PROCUREMENT FOR SWIMMING POOL EQUIPMEN

"1 DISC 2 DISC '3 DISC
ITEM # PRICE PRICE PRICE
1 11275 11,275 13,190 13,190 13739 13,739
2 5,126 5126) 5012 5012) 5109 5109/
3 4,201 4,201 %% 4,039 4,0397 % 3926 3,926 (¥
4 9,691 9,691, 9279 9,279 | 9,208 9,208 )
LO PREF NA N/A NA
w0l k{5290 % 15242
BIDDERS o , '
"1 RECREONICS, INC. (W/OUT LOCAL PREFERENCE)
2 W.M. SMITH & ASSOC. (W/OUT LOCAL PREFERENCE)

‘3 MULTITECH (W/OUT LOCAL PREFERENCE)




