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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

SEPTEMBER 17, 2007
TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER
FROM: WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER W
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007

RFB2008-035-WR
TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE

I RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR RECOMMENDED FOR PAYMENT
GE%UP ITEM DESCRIPTION AWARD GROUP TOTAL TERMS
1 Plumbing services for various departments (except Primary: Aardvark Company, Inc. $107,000.00 30 days
Albuquerque Housing Services) Secondary: Armstrong Services $ 176,457.50
5 HydOJ_et service for various departments {except Albuguerque Armstrong Services $ 17,100.00 30 days
Housing Services)
3 Plumbing services for Albuquerque Housing Services Primary: Aardvark Company, Inc. $ 80,150.00 30 days
residential Secondary: Armstrong Services $ 150,137.50
4 Hydrojet services for Albuquerque Housing Services residential Armstrong Services $ 17,100.00 30 days
5 Plumbing services for Albuquerque Housing Services Primary: Aardvark Company, Inc. $ 80,150.00 30 days
commercial Secondary: Armstrong Services $ 150,137.50
6 Hydrojet service for Albuguerque Housing Services commercial Armstrong Services $17,100.00 30 days

THIS IS ARECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: qz,’_lﬁlQ 7 . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: 2 ,’gﬂo I4




City of Albuquerque
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From Item No.: 1 To item No.: 8
$107,000.00 $101,650.00 AARDVARK CO. INC.
$176,457.50 $167,634.63 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.
From Iltem No.: 9 To Item No.: 9
$0.00 $0.00 * AARDVARK CO. INC.
$17,100.00 $16,245.00 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.
From item No.: 10 To ltem No.: 17
$80,150.00 $76,142.50 AARDVARK CO. INC.
$150,137.50 $142,630.63 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.
From Item No.. 18 To item No.: 18
$0.00 $0.00 * AARDVARK CO. INC.
$17,100.00 $16,245.00 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 19 To item No.: 26
$80,150.00 $76,142.50 AARDVARK CO. INC.
$150,137.50 $142,630.63 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.
From ltem No.: 27 To ltem No.: 27
$0.00 $0.00 * AARDVARK CO. INC.
$17,100.00 $16,245.00 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC.

Total Offers = 12

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No Bid'
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City of Albugquergue
AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response

Vendor Preference

Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 AARDVARK CO. INC. LOCAL BUSI
2 ARMSTRONG SERVICES, INC. LOCAL BUSI

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 1 1000
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $57.0000 $81.2300
EXT. PRICE $57,000.00 $81,230.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
1 2 500
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $28.5000 $43.8200
EXT. PRICE $14,250.00 $21,910.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
1 3 200
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $57.0000 $106.3400
EXT. PRICE $11,400.00 $21,268.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 100
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $28.5000
EXT. PRICE $2,850.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 5 200
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $60.0000
EXT. PRICE $12,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 6 100
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $30.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTyYy

1 7 50
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $3,250.00

September 17, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

HR
$65.7300
$6.573.00

HR
$120.7700
$24,154.00

HR
$76.4200
$7,642.00

HR
$120.7700
$6.038.50
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM Qrty
1 8 100
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $32.5000 $76.4200
EXT. PRICE $3,250.00 $7.642.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

2 9 100
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS. HO
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $171.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $17,100.00

GROUP TEM QTYy

3 10 700
HOUSING RE SIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $47.0000 $81.2300
EXT. PRICE $32,900.00 $56,861.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 11 300
HOUSING RE SIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $23.0000 $43.8200
EXT. PRICE $6,900.00 $13,146.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
3 12 300
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $57.0000
EXT. PRICE $17,100.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
3 13 100
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,600.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 14 200
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $13,000.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

3 15 100
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,600.00

September 17, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

HR
$106.3400
$31,902.00

HR
$65.7300
$6,573.00

HR
$120.7700
$24,154.00

HR
$76.4200
$7.642.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTy

3 16 50
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $75.0000 $120.7700
EXT. PRICE $3,750.00 $6,038.50

GROUP ITEM QTty

3 17 50
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000 $76.4200
EXT. PRICE $1,300.00 $3,821.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

4 18 100
HOUSING RESIDENTIAL. HOUR
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $171.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $17,100.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 19 700
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $47.0000 $81.2300
EXT. PRICE $32,900.00 $56.861.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY
5 20 300
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $23.0000
EXT. PRICE $6,900.00

GROUP ITEM QTy
5 21 300
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $57.0000
EXT. PRICE $17,100.00

GROUP ITEM QTYy

5 22 100
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000
EXT. PRICE $2,600.00

GROUP ITEM QTY
5 23 200
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU

RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU HR
UNIT PRICE $65.0000
EXT. PRICE $13,000.00

September 17, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

HR
$43.8200
$13,146.00

HR
$106.3400
$31,902.00

HR
$65.7300
$6,573.00

HR
$120.7700
$24,154.00
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REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-035-WR
BID TITLE: SEWER, GAS AND PLUMBING SERVICE
BID OPENING DATE: 9/12/2007
WAYNE RIDDLE, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY
5 24 100
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU

RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?

SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000 $76.4200
EXT. PRICE $2,600.00 $7,642.00

GROUP ITEM QTY

5 25 50
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $75.0000 $120.7700
EXT. PRICE $3,750.00 $6,038.50

GROUP ITEM QTy

5 26 50
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $26.0000 $76.4200
EXT. PRICE $1,300.00 $3,821.00

GROUP ITEM QTy

6 27 100
HOUSING COMMERCIAL. HOU
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU HR HR
UNIT PRICE $0.0000 $171.0000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $17,100.00
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