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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

DECEMBER 19, 2007

TO: JOHN J. VIGIL, PURCHASING MANAGER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2008- BID OPENING DATE: 12/5/2007
069-DG

TITLE: FROZEN FISH ITEMS

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: CULTURAL SERVICES

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
PRIMARY VENDOR
1 5000 Ib Mackeral, Pacific Atlantic/Pacific $0.95/lb $ 4750.00
2 400 1b Smelt, night, 23 Brown ST. N/B
3 500 b Clams, Quahog N. Kingstown, Rl 02852 $1.75/b $ 875.00
4 2500 Ib Shrimp, whole $3.50/Ib $ 8750.00
5 2500 Ib Shrimp, peeled $3.25/lb $ 8125.00
6 2500 b Krill, superba $2.55/lb  $15,300.00
7 1400 Ib Krill, pacifica $1.75/b $ 2450.00
8 4000 Ib Squid, loligo, season $1.25/b $ 5000.00
9 30,000 Ib mackerel, season $0.53/Ib $15,390.00
10 35,000 Ib Herring, season $0.45/b $15,750.00
$76,900.00
SECONDARY VENDOR
11 5000 Ib Mackeral, Pacific McRoberts Sales $0.76/lb  $3,800.00
12 400 Ib Smelt, night PO Box 489 $2.40/1b 960.00
13 500 b Clams, Ruskin, FL 33575 $3.30/lb  1,650.00
14 2500 tb Shrimp, whole $3.90/b  $9,750.00
15 2500 Ib Shrimp, peeled $3.40/Ib  $ 8,500.00
16 6000 Ib Krill, superba, $2.10/lb $ 960.00

17 1400 Ib Krill, pacifica $1.80/ib $2520.00



18 4000 Ib Squid, Loligo, season $1.38/lb  $5520.00
19 30,000. Ib Mackeral Season

$0.76/lb  $22,800.00
20 35,000 Ib Herring. Season $0.70/b  $24,500.00

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON:

o . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:
APPR ‘ APPROVED:
e N L/ ﬁmwww/ ofaf
JOHN J. L [/ (DATE) TONI MARTORELLI, DIRECTOR '(DATH)
PURCHASIN AGER

CULTURAL SERVICES



Item

AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-069-DG
BID TITLE: FROZEN FISH ITEMS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments

From ltem No.: 1 To Item 10

$72,625.00 $72,625.00 * ATLANTIC/PACIFIC
$92,600.00 $92,600.00 MCROBERTS SALES CO. INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No
December 5, 2007

Total Offers 2
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM il
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 ATLANTIC / PACIFIC 7-10 DAYS SUBJECT TO SEASON.
2 MCROBERTS SALES CO. INC. WITHIN 14 DAYS OF ORDER
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-069-DG
BID TITLE: FROZEN FISH ITEMS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/5/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTy

1 1 5000
MACKERAL, PACIFIC PER BID
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU LB LB
UNIT $0.0950 $0.7600
EXT. PRICE $475.00 $3,800.00
GROUP ITEM QTy

1 2 400
SMELT, NIGHT, SEASON SEE
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU LB LB
UNIT $0.0000 $2.4000
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $960.00
GROUP ITEM QTYy

1 3 500
CLAMS, QUAHOG. SEASON:
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU EA EA
UNIT $1.7500 $3.3000
EXT. PRICE $875.00 $1,650.00

December 5, 2007
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 4 2500
SHRIMP, WHOLE. SEASON:
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LB
UNIT $3.5000
EXT. PRICE $8,750.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 2500
SHRIMP, PEELED, SEASON:
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LB
UNIT $3.2500
EXT. PRICE $8,125.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 6000
KRILL, SUPERBA. SEASON:
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LB
UNIT $2.5500
EXT. PRICE $15,300.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 7 1400
KRILL, PACIFICA. SEASON:
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU LB
UNIT $1.7500
EXT. PRICE $2,450.00

December 5, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-069-DG
BID TITLE: FROZEN FiSH ITEMS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/5/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

LB
$3.8000
$9.750.00

2

LB
$3.4000
$8.500.00

2

LB
$2.1000
$12,600.00

2

LB
$1.8000
$2,520.00
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GROUP ITEM Qry

1 8 4000
SQUID, LOLIGO. SEASON:
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LB
UNIT $1.2500
EXT. PRICE $5,000.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 9 30000
MACKEREL: SEASON: YEAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LB
UNIT $0.5300
EXT. PRICE $15,900.00
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 10 35000
HERRING: SEASON: YEAR
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?

SKU LB
UNIT $0.4500
EXT. PRICE $15,750.00

December 5, 2007

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-069-DG
BID TITLE: FROZEN FISH ITEMS
BID OPENING DATE: 12/5/2007
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

LB
$1.3800
$5,520.00

2

LB
$0.7600
$22,800.00

2

LB
$0.7000
$24,500.00
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2008-069-DG
BID TITLE: FROZEN FISH ITEMS
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: 1 To Item 10
$72,625.00 $72,625.00 * ATLANTIC/ PACIFIC
$92,600.00 $92,600.00 MCROBERTS SALES CO. INC.
Total Offers 2

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
December 5, 2007
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