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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

MARCH 6, 2006

TO: RONN D. JONES, PURCHASING OFFICER

FROM: DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER

SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER RFB2006- BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
108-DG

TITLE: SEED, BULBS AND PLUGS - PRICE AGREEMENT

| RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-STATE
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED BY: VARIOUS

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO.  QUANTITY ITEM DESCRIPTION FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
PRINCING AGREEMENT:
1 300 dollars Seeds Grimes Seed & Plant 49% off catalog net
2 6000 dollars Plugs 11335 Concord-Hambdgn Rd 5% off catalog
3 20,000 dollars Plugs over $10k/year Concord, OH 44077 7% off catalog
4 9,000 dollars Bulbs. 5% off catalog
5 20,000 dollars Bulbs over $10k/year 7% off catalog
6 6000 dollars Plugs K. Van Bourgondien of Virginia  Based on qty. discount off of catalog.
7 20,000 dollars Plugs over $10k/year 2820 Crusader Circle Based on qty. discount off of catalog
8 9,000 dollars Bulbs Virginia Beach, VA 23453 20% off catalog price
9 20,000 dollars Bulbs over $10k/year 20% off catalog price

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD. ACTUA}_ A\yARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIVISION BY
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDSON:__ &//5/()ly . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION:

’ 7

APPROVE

/Jo NJ.V, (DATE)
OFFICER




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM i
ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT

Response  Vendor Preference
Number Name Type Delivery Notes
1 K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, AS REQUESTED.
2 GRIMES SEED
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-108-DG
BID TITLE: SEED, BULBS AND PLUGS - PRICE AGREEMENT
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

GROUP ITEM QTY

1 300
SEEDS. STATE
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID? Y
SKU DL DL
UNIT $0.0000 $0.4900
EXT. PRICE $0.00 $147.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

2 6000
PLUGS. PERCENTAGE OF
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU DL DL
UNIT $0.0500 $0.4900
EXT. PRICE $300.00 $2,940.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

3 20000
PLUGS. HIGHEST GRADES.
RESPONSE 1 2
NO BID?
SKU DL DL
UNIT $0.0700 $0.0500
EXT. PRICE $1,400.00 $1,000.00
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GROUP ITEM QTY

4 9000
BULBS. HIGHEST GRADE.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU DL
UNIT $0.0500
EXT. PRICE $450.00
GROUP ITEM QTY

5 20000
BULBS. HIGHEST QUALITY.
RESPONSE 1
NO BID?
SKU DL
UNIT $0.0700
EXT. PRICE $1,400.00

March 8, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-108-DG
BID TITLE: SEED, BULBS AND PLUGS - PRICE AGREEMENT
BID OPENING DATE: 2/15/2006
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

DL
$0.0700
$630.00

2

DL
$0.0500
$1,000.00
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM Ii
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-108-DG

BID TITLE: SEED, BULBS AND PLUGS - PRICE AGREEMENT
DENISE GALLEGOS, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

Item Bid Amount Discounted Bid Vendor Name/Comments
From ltem No.: To ltem
$0.00 $0.00 * K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, INC.
$147.00 $147.00 GRIMES SEED
From item No.: To item
$300.00 $300.00 K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, INC.
$2,940.00 $2,940.00 GRIMES SEED
From ltem No.: To item
$1,000.00 $1,000.00 GRIMES SEED
$1,400.00 $1,400.00 K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, INC.
From ltem No.: To ltem
$450.00 $450.00 K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, INC.
$630.00 $630.00 GRIMES SEED
From item No.: To ltem
$1,000.00 $1,000.00 GRIMES SEED
$1,400.00 $1,400.00 K. VAN BOURGONDIEN & SONS, INC.

* Denotes that at least one item in the Group was 'No

March 8, 2006

Total Offers 10
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