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CITY OF ALBUQUERQUE

ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

APRIL 14, 2006

TO: JOHN VIGIL, ACTING PURCHASING OFFICER
FROM: G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER
SUBJECT: RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD ON REQUEST FOR OFFER BID OPENING 4/12/2006

RFB2006-120-GJ
TITLE: MAINTANCE & REPAIR FOR COMPRESSORS

' RECOMMEND AWARDING THE FOLLOWING AS THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE BID OFFER AFTER MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. LOCAL AND IN-
PREFERENCES, IF APPLICABLE, HAVE BEEN TAKEN INTO CONSIDERATION. THIS CONTRACT WILL BE USED SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT

VENDOR
ITEM RECOMMENDED UNIT TOTAL PAYMENT
NO. QUANTITY ITEM FOR AWARD AMOUNT AMOUNT TERMS
1 1TO6 Wisco Supply $2,492.88

THIS IS A RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD, NOT AN ACTUAL AWARD: ACTUAL AWARD IS MADE BY THE PURCHASING DIV[%%
ISSUING A PURCHASE ORDER AFTER THE PROTEST PERIOD ENDS ON: _ (> IO . DATE OF RECOMMENDATION: ¢ . 2( A o

2= %//4«‘ %\ZF?W%WM@(

IGM/ ‘(DATE) 'LEGNARD GARCIA, DIRECTOR (DATE)
ACTING PURC G OFFICER




AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM I
OFFERS FOR PROCUREMENT

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-120-GJ
BID TITLE: MAINTANCE & REPAIR FOR COMPRESSORS
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505)768-3320

item Bid Amount Discounted Vendor
From Item 1 To ltem 6
$2,492.88 $2,368.23 WISCO SUPPLY
$6,169.92 $5,861.43 MESA EQUIPMENT
$9,159.66 $8,701.68 AIR POWER SW
Total Offers = 3

* Denotes that at least one Item in the Group was 'No
April 14, 2006
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AUTOMATED PURCHASING SYSTEM |

ABSTRACT DETAIL REPORT
Respons Vendor Preferenc
eNumber Name eType Delivery
1 MESA EQUIPMENT LOCAL MANU
2 AIR POWER SW LOCAL BUSI
3 WISCO SUPPLY LOCAL BUSI
REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-120-GJ
BID TITLE: MAINTANCE & REPAIR FOR COMPRESSORS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/8/2006
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320
GROUP ITEM QTyY
1 1 2
QUINCY OTV-10-120
RESPONS 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT $769.4000 $1,121.4400 $183.9700
EXT. PRICE $1,538.80 $2,242.88 $367.94
GROUP ITEM QTyYy
1 2 2
QUINCY MODEL QT-15
RESPONS 1 2 3
NO BID?
SKU EA EA EA
UNIT $838.8000 $760.0000 $183.9700
EXT. PRICE $1,677.60 $1,520.00 $367.94

April 14, 2006
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GROUP ITEM QTY

1 3 1
QUINCY MODEL OT-10
RESPONS 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $197.0600
EXT. PRICE $197.06
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 4 1
QUINCY MODEL 0SB 30
RESPONS 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $1,638.6200
EXT. PRICE $1,638.62
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 5 1
CHAMPION MODEL # HR10-8
RESPONS 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $197.0600
EXT. PRICE $197.06
GROUP ITEM  QTY

1 6 1
GARDNER DENVER MODEL
RESPONS 1
NO BID?
SKU EA
UNIT $920.7800
EXT. PRICE $920.78

Aprit 14, 2006

REQUEST FOR BID NUMBER: RFB2006-120-GJ
BID TITLE: MAINTANCE & REPAIR FOR COMPRESSORS
BID OPENING DATE: 3/8/2006
G. JARAMILLO, SENIOR BUYER, PHONE NO.: (505) 768-3320

2

EA
$667.0000
$667.00

2

EA
$2,895.8800
$2,895.88

2

EA
$580.0000
$580.00

2

EA
$1,253.9000
$1,253.90

3

EA
$183.9700
$183.97

3

EA
$1,239.0300
$1,239.03

3

EA
$128.0000
$128.00

3

EA
$206.0000
$206.00
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